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DAVID R. ZARO (BAR NO. 124334) 
PETER A. GRIFFIN (BAR NO. 306201) 
865 South Figueroa Street, Suite 2800 
Los Angeles, California 90017-2543 
Phone:  (213) 622-5555 
Fax:  (213) 620-8816 
E-Mail:  dzaro@allenmatkins.com 

pgriffin@allenmatkins.com 
 
ALLEN MATKINS LECK GAMBLE 
   MALLORY & NATSIS LLP 
EDWARD G. FATES (BAR NO. 227809) 
One America Plaza 
600 West Broadway, 27th Floor 
San Diego, California 92101-0903 
Phone:  (619) 233-1155 
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Attorneys for Receiver 
THOMAS A. SEAMAN 
 

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 

CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA 

SOUTHERN DIVISION 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION, 

Plaintiff, 
v. 

EMILIO FRANCISCO; PDC CAPITAL 
GROUP, LLC; CAFFE PRIMO 
INTERNATIONAL, INC.; SAL ASSISTED 
LIVING, LP; SAL CARMICHAEL, LP; SAL 
CITRUS HEIGHTS, LP; SAL KERN 
CANYON, LP; SAL PHOENIX, LP; SAL 
WESTGATE, LP; SUMMERPLACE AT 
SARASOTA, LP; SUMMERPLACE AT 
CLEARWATER, LP; SUMMERPLACE AT 
CORRELL PALMS, LP; TRC TUCSON, LP; 
CLEAR CURRENTS WEST, LP; CAFFE 
PRIMO MANAGEMENT, LP; CAFFE 
PRIMO MANAGEMENT 102, LP; CAFFE 
PRIMO MANAGEMENT 103, LP; CAFFE 
PRIMO MANAGEMENT 104, LP; CAFFE 
PRIMO MANAGEMENT 105, LP; CAFFE 
PRIMO MANAGEMENT 106, LP; CAFFE 
PRIMO MANAGEMENT 107, LP; and 
CAFFE PRIMO MANAGEMENT 108, LP, 

Defendants. 

Case No. 8:16-cv-02257-CJC-DFM 
 
SIXTH INTERIM FEE 
APPLICATION OF THOMAS A. 
SEAMAN, COURT-APPOINTED 
RECEIVER, FOR PAYMENT OF 
FEES FOR MAY 1, 2018, 
THROUGH JULY 31, 2018 
 
Date: October 29, 2018 
Time: 1:30 p.m. 
Ctrm: 9B, 9th Floor 
Judge: Hon. Cormac J. Carney 
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Thomas A. Seaman ("Receiver"), the Court-appointed receiver for the 

Defendant entities and their subsidiaries and affiliates (collectively, "Receivership 

Entities"), hereby submits this sixth interim application for approval and payment of 

fees ("Application").  This Application covers the period from May 1, 2018, through 

July 31, 2018 ("Sixth Application Period"), and seeks interim approval of 

$122,902.00 in fees and an order authorizing the Receiver to pay, on an interim 

basis, 90% of the fees incurred, or $110,611.80. 

During the Sixth Application Period, the Receiver and his staff spent 

903.7 hours executing the duties set forth in the Temporary Restraining Order 

entered on January 5, 2017 ("TRO"), and the subsequent Preliminary Injunction 

Against All Defendants entered on January 23, 2017 ("PI Order"). 

Since the inception of the receivership in January 2017, gross receipts to the 

estate are $13,485,777.68.  As of July 31, 2018, the Receiver was holding cash in 

the amount of $9,203,055.83.  By this Application, the Receiver seeks approval of 

$122,902.00 in fees incurred during the Sixth Application Period.  The fees were 

incurred at hourly rates ranging from $60 to $375 per hour, at a weighted average 

hourly rate of $136 per hour.  The Receiver seeks approval to pay 90% of this 

amount, or $110,611.80. 

I. SCOPE OF RECEIVER'S WORK 

The Receiver filed his Seventh Report on September 20, 2018 (Dkt. No. 295), 

which provides a detailed accounting and narrative of the Receiver's activities 

during the Sixth Application Period.  As set forth in the Receiver's Seventh Interim 

Report ("Seventh Report"), the Receiver made significant progress monetizing and 

otherwise disposing of the assets of the Receivership Entities for the benefit of the 

receivership estate investors and other claimants.  The Receiver concurrently 

established a claims bar date, sought and was granted Court approval of a claims 

process, and has analyzed and reconciled most non-investor claims.  Accordingly, 
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the Receiver will be able to propose a plan of distribution in the coming months as 

the remaining assets are monetized. 

More specifically, the Receiver worked to market and sell real and personal 

property interests, including settlement of the dispute concerning MCC's loan and 

lien interests in connection with a sale of the Lincoln Red Rock and the Sarasota 

properties.  The Receiver also concluded the sale of the other three Sacramento area 

properties and concluded at settlement involving a buyout of the Receivership 

Entities' interest in a partnership that owns an assisted living facility in Rancho 

Cordova, California.  The Receiver also concluded a reorganization of a partnership 

that owned a vacant medical office building in Phoenix contemplated to be 

redeveloped into an assisted living community.  In addition, sale contracts for the 

Clearwater, Florida and Summerfield, Florida properties were executed.  These 

transactions will likely close in the coming quarter. 

The Receiver also entered into a contract to sell the Lincoln Village property 

and negotiated a discounted payoff of the underlying secured debt from the 

anticipated sale proceeds.  Due diligence is ongoing and if it is satisfactory, the sale 

will close by year end 2018.  The Receiver also reached a settlement with the lender 

that holds a mortgage on the property in Sun City, Florida, which will dispose of 

that property.  Assets still requiring resolution include Professional Loading 

Services, an ammunition company and associated real property located in Montana, 

Tucson TRC, a skilled nursing facility, land located in Stockton and Merced, 

California, and a parcel of land in Kissimmee, Florida. 

The Receiver also made progress with his forensic accounting and analysis of 

the Receivership Entities' financial transactions, including (a) evaluating, 

developing, and pursuing claims against third parties, and (b) formulating 

procedures and evaluating investor claims, including filing a motion for approval of 

a claims process and setting a deadline to submit claims, or bar date.  The Receiver 

Case 8:16-cv-02257-CJC-DFM   Document 296   Filed 09/21/18   Page 3 of 83   Page ID
 #:10153



1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

 

874655.01/SD -3- 
 

LAW OFFICES 

Allen Matkins Leck Gamble 
Mallory & Natsis LLP 

is in the process of evaluating claims.  Investor claim amounts are straightforward; 

however, certain creditor and other claims may require objections. 

The Receiver has commenced two related actions against insiders to recover 

transfers, for breach of fiduciary duty, negligence, and aiding and abetting the 

underlying diversion of funds.  He also concluded long-running efforts to obtain 

compliance with a subpoena by Eric Bronk, the Receivership Entities' former 

counsel. 

A. Receivership Accounting - Receipts and Disbursements 

The Receiver's Seventh Report provides a profit and loss statement, balance 

sheet and detailed general ledger as well as a Standardized Fund Accounting Report 

("SFAR") for the period ending July 31, 2018.  The SFAR is also attached hereto as 

Exhibit B for reference.  During the Sixth Application Period ending July 31, 2018, 

the Receiver recovered $5,969,091, which can be summarized as follows: 

Business Asset Liquidation $   5,954,529 
Interest Income $        14,562 
Cash and Securities $             0 
Total $    5,969,091 

 

The Receiver was holding cash in the amount of $9,203,055.83 as of July 31, 

2018. 

II. SUMMARY OF RECEIVER'S FEES 

Exhibit A provides a summary by timekeeper of the total fees for the Sixth 

Application Period of $122,902.00, as well as a detailed listing of every task 

performed by the Receiver or his agents.  The fees were incurred by month as 

follows: 

May 2018 $   63,561.00 
June 2018 $   34,798.00 
July 2018 $   24,543.00 
Total $ 122,902.00 
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In order to reduce fees, the Receiver delegates work to lower priced 

employees of the Receiver at rates ranging from $60 to $210 per hour.  These 

employees worked 815.3 hours at an average hourly rate of $110, bringing the 

weighted average hourly rate to $136 per hour.  The Receiver has discounted his 

normal hourly rate from $400 to $375 throughout this case, which resulted in 

savings of $2,210 during the Sixth Application Period.  The Receiver also does not 

bill for the cost to prepare fee applications, which cost $940.50 in the Sixth 

Application Period and is reflected as "No Charge" on the detailed bills. 

III. SUMMARY OF CHARGES BY TASK 

The following summarizes the charges listed in Exhibit A by category of fees: 

Task Hours Amount 
Accounting and Reporting 35.8 $3,394.00 
Forensic Accounting 417.7 $43,370.00 
Investor Relations 248.5 $23,808.50 
Litigation & Support 3.6 $756.00 
Manage Business 2.1 $388.50 
Project Management 31.7 $5,822.50 
Property Management 24.3 $4,463.50 
Receiver 88.4 $33,150.00 
Receivership Administration 10.2 $659.50 
Sell Liquidate Assets 41.4 $7,089.50 

Total All Activities 903.7 $122,902.00 

Accounting and Reporting. 

This category covers accounting for receipts and disbursements of the 

receivership estate.  For the Sixth Application Period, 35.82 hours were spent on 

these tasks for a total of $3,394.  The average hourly rate was $95. 

Forensic Accounting. 

This category includes forensic accounting of the Receivership Entities' pre-

TRO activities.  For the Sixth Application Period, 417.7 hours were spent on these 
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tasks for a total of $43,370.  The average hourly rate was $104.  As noted above, 

this includes manual entry of transactions from bank statements into a QuickBooks 

database designed to identify assets, determine payments made to insiders and other 

possible recipients of ill-gotten gains, establish the cost basis of assets, provide a 

basis for investor claims, ascertain monetary damages, and otherwise inform 

interested parties as to the financial behavior of the Receivership Entities prior to 

entry of the TRO.  The forensic accounting work is nearing conclusion and the fees 

have declined significantly from prior application periods. 

Investor relations. 

This category includes responding to investor inquiries and maintaining the 

receivership website.  For the Sixth Application Period, 3.6 hours were spent on 

these tasks for a total of $756.  The average hourly rate was $210. 

Litigation & Support. 

This category covers a variety of functions related to the support of litigation 

on behalf of the receivership or investor/victims.  During the Sixth Application 

Period, 5.2 hours for a total of $1,092 were spent on these tasks.  The average hourly 

rate was $210. 

Manage Business. 

The Caffe Primo restaurants could not be operated and the costs for managing 

the businesses is therefore low.  For the Sixth Application Period, 2.1 hours were 

spent on administering matters arising from terminating operations at a cost of 

$388.50.  The average hourly rate was $185. 

Project Management. 

During the Sixth Application Period, a total of 31.7 hours were expended 

managing the affairs of the receivership estate for a total of $5,822.50, which 

equates to $184 per hour.  Tasks performed in this category include: 

 Investigation and discovery 

 Support EB-5 investor applications with USCIS 
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 Real estate management 

 Asset recovery 

 Monitoring Professional Loading Services, LLLP (aka Prograde) 

 Supporting marketing and sale of real properties 

Property Management. 

During the Sixth Application Period, a total of 24.3 hours were expended 

maintaining the properties of the receivership estate for a total of $4,463.50, which 

equates to $184 per hour. 

Receiver. 

This category is only used by the Receiver and includes work to manage the 

myriad requirements of the receivership estate as set forth in the scope of the 

Receiver's work above, including marketing and sale of assets, evaluation and 

renegotiation of debt, and overseeing forensic accounting.  During this Sixth 

Application Period, the Receiver devoted 88.4 hours, or approximately 18% of his 

time to the receivership estate affairs.  At his discounted hourly rate of $375, the 

total cost is $33,150. 

Receivership Administration. 

The work is primarily comprised of document preservation and organization, 

and review of incoming mail, which provides invaluable clues to locating assets and 

other matters requiring the attention of the Receiver.  This category required 

10.2 hours of time for a total of $659.50, or $65 per hour. 

Sell/Liquidate Assets. 

This category includes work in preparing assets for sale, such as 

commissioning appraisals and retaining listing brokers, ordering title reports, 

preparing properties for sale, including cleaning and non-capital repairs, entertaining 

offers and negotiating sales, documenting sales, and administering escrows to 

conclude the sales.  The hours worked were 41.4 for a total of $7,089.50, or 

$171 per hour. 
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IV. PRIOR FEE APPLICATIONS 

In his First Interim Fee Application, the Receiver sought approval of 

$297,672.50 in fees and an interim payment of 90%, or $267,905.20, with the 

remaining 10% voluntarily held back until the conclusion of the receivership.  Dkt. 

No. 103.  The Receiver's First Interim Fee Application was granted on 

September 25, 2017.  Dkt. No. 108. 

In his Second Interim Fee Application, the Receiver sought approval of 

$170,094.00 in fees and an interim payment of 90%, or $153,084.60, with the 

remaining 10% voluntarily held back until the conclusion of the receivership.  Dkt. 

No. 145.  The Receiver's Second Interim Fee Application was granted January 23, 

2017.  Dkt. No. 161. 

In his Third Interim Fee Application, the Receiver sought approval of 

$232,682.50 in fees and an interim payment of 90%, or $209,414.25, with the 

remaining 10% voluntarily held back until the conclusion of the receivership.  Dkt. 

No. 195.  The Receiver's Third Interim Fee Application was granted March 9, 2018.  

Dkt. No. 204. 

In his Fourth Interim Fee Application, the Receiver sought approval of 

$235,297.50 in fees and an interim payment of 90%, or $211,767.75, with the 

remaining 10% voluntarily held back until the conclusion of the receivership.  Dkt. 

No. 235.  The Receiver's Fourth Interim Fee Application was granted May 3, 2018.  

Dkt. No. 250. 

In his Fifth Interim Fee Application, the Receiver sought approval of 

$124,121.00 in fees and an interim payment of 90%, or $111,708.90, with the 

remaining 10% voluntarily held back until the conclusion of the receivership.  Dkt. 

No. 269.  The Receiver's Fifth Interim Fee Application was granted July 5, 2018.  

Dkt. No. 276. 
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For the Sixth Application Period, the Receiver's fees are 2% of the gross 

receipts.  Inception-to-date through July 31, 2018, the Receiver's fees are 

$1,182,769.50, or 8.8% of gross receipts. 

V. THE FEES COSTS ARE REASONABLE 

AND SHOULD BE ALLOWED 

"As a general rule, the expenses and fees of a receivership are a charge upon 

the property administered."  Gaskill v. Gordon, 27 F. 3d 248, 251 (7th Cir. 1994).  

These expenses include the fees and expenses of this Receiver and his professionals, 

including Allen Matkins.  Decisions regarding the timing and amount of an award of 

fees and costs to the Receiver and his Professionals are committed to the sound 

discretion of the Court.  See SEC v. Elliot, 953 F. 2d 1560, 1577 (11th Cir. 1992) 

(rev'd in part on other grounds, 998 F.2d 922 (11th Cir. 1993)). 

In allowing fees, a court should consider "the time, labor and skill required, 

but not necessarily that actually expended, in the proper performance of the duties 

imposed by the court upon the receiver, the fair value of such time, labor and skill 

measured by conservative business standards, the degree of activity, integrity and 

dispatch with which the work is conducted and the result obtained."  United States v. 

Code Prods. Corp., 362 F. 2d 669, 673 (3d Cir. 1966) (internal quotation marks 

omitted).  In practical terms, receiver and professional compensation thus ultimately 

rests upon the result of an equitable, multi-factor balancing test involving the 

"economy of administration, the burden that the estate may be able to bear, the 

amount of time required, although not necessarily expended, and the overall value of 

the services to the estate."  In re Imperial 400 Nat'l, Inc., 432 F. 2d 232, 237 (3d Cir. 

1970).  Regardless of how this balancing test is formulated, no single factor is 

determinative and "a reasonable fee is based [upon] all circumstances surrounding 

the receivership."  SEC v. W.L. Moody & Co., Bankers (Unincorporated), 

374 F. Supp. 465, 480 (S.D. Tex. 1974). 
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp6 Summary By Timekeeper
Page 1 of 2

Thomas Seaman, Receiver Hours Rate Cost
May-18 31.7                 $375.00 $11,887.50
Jun-18 30.5                 $375.00 $11,437.50
Jul-18 26.2                 $375.00 $9,825.00
Total 88.4               $375.00 $33,150.00

Marlyn Roge Hours Rate Cost
May-18 43.5                 $210.00 $9,142.00
Jun-18 -                   $0.00 $0.00
Jul-18 -                   $0.00 $0.00
Total 43.5               $210.00 $9,142.00

Alison Juroe, Project Manager Hours Rate Cost
May-18 78.6                 $210.00 $16,506.00
Jun-18 12.1                 $210.00 $2,541.00
Jul-18 12.2                 $210.00 $2,562.00
Total 102.9             $210.00 $21,609.00

Darren Clevenger, Project Manager Hours Rate Cost
May-18 26.1                 $185.00 $4,828.50
Jun-18 17.8                 $185.00 $3,293.00
Jul-18 17.1                 $185.00 $3,163.50
Total 61.0               $185.00 $11,285.00

Timothy McDonnell, Project Manager Hours Rate Cost
May-18 28.0                 $165.00 $4,620.00
Jun-18 32.7                 $165.00 $5,395.50
Jul-18 9.5                   $165.00 $1,567.50
Total 70.2               $165.00 $11,583.00

May 1, 2018, through July 31, 2018

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for PDC Capital Group LLC et al
Sixth Interim Fee Application

Summary of Fees
Summary By Timekeeper

Exhibit A - Page 11
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp6 Summary By Timekeeper
Page 2 of 2

Various Adminstrative Assistants Hours Rate Cost
May-18 247.4               $67.00 $16,577.00
Jun-18 184.1               $66.00 $12,131.00
Jul-18 106.2               $70.00 $7,425.00
Total 537.7             $67.00 $36,133.00

Total Hours Rate Cost
May-18 455.3               $140.00 $63,561.00
Jun-18 277.2               $126.00 $34,798.00
Jul-18 171.2               $143.00 $24,543.00
Total, Receiver and Agent hours 903.7             $136.00 $122,902.00

Exhibit A - Page 12
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp6 Summary By Task
Page 1 of 3

Task Hours Rate Amount

Accounting and Reporting 35.8                $95 $3,394.00
Forensic Accounting 417.7              $104 $43,370.00
Investor Relations 248.5              $96 $23,808.50
Litigation & Support 3.6                  $210 $756.00
Manage Business 2.1                  $185 $388.50
Project Management 31.7                $184 $5,822.50
Property Management 24.3                $184 $4,463.50
Receiver 88.4                $375 $33,150.00
Receivership Administration 10.2                $65 $659.50
Sell Liquidate Assets 41.4                $171 $7,089.50
Total All Activities 903.7            $136 $122,902.00

Thomas Seaman, Receiver for PDC Capital Group LLC et al
Sixth Interim Fee Application

Summary By Task
May 1, 2018, through July 31, 2018

Accounting and 
Reporting; $3,394.00 

; 3%

Forensic 
Accounting; 
$43,370.00 ; 

35%

Investor Relations; 
$23,808.50 ; 19%

Litigation & Support; 
$756.00 ; 1%

Manage Business; 
$388.50 ; 0%

Project Management; 
$5,822.50 ; 5%

Property 
Management; 
$4,463.50 ; 4%

Receiver; 
$33,150.00 ; 

27%

Receivership 
Administration; 
$659.50 ; 0%

Sell Liquidate Assets; 
$7,089.50 ; 6%

Task Summary

Exhibit A - Page 13
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp6 Summary By Task
Page 2 of 3

Accounting and Reporting Hours Rate
Accounting and 

Reporting
May-18 16.6                $103 $1,712.50
Jun-18 10.7                $82 $874.00
Jul-18 8.5                  $95 $807.50
Total Accounting and Reporting 35.8              $95 $3,394.00

Forensic Accounting Hours Rate Forensic Accounting
May-18 254.7              $123 $31,255.00
Jun-18 106.6              $71 $7,606.50
Jul-18 56.4                $80 $4,508.50
Total Forensic Accounting 417.7              $104 $43,370.00

Investor Relations Hours Rate Investor Relations 
May-18 116.1              $109 $12,616.00
Jun-18 79.7                $82 $6,562.50
Jul-18 52.7                $88 $4,630.00
Total Investor Relations 248.5            $96 $23,808.50

Litigation & Support Hours Rate Litigation & Support
May-18 -                 $0 $0.00
Jun-18 3.6                  $210 $756.00
Jul-18 -                 $0 $0.00
Total Litigation & Support 3.6                $210 $756.00

Manage Business Hours Rate Manage Business
May-18 2.1                  $185 $388.50
Jun-18 -                 $0 $0.00
Jul-18 -                 $0 $0.00
Total Manage Business 2.1                $185 $388.50

Project Management Hours Rate Project Management
May-18 14.8                $188 $2,779.50
Jun-18 6.5                  $179 $1,164.50
Jul-18 10.4                $181 $1,878.50
Total Project Management 31.7              $184 $5,822.50

Exhibit A - Page 14
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Thomas Seaman Company FeeApp6 Summary By Task
Page 3 of 3

Property Management Hours Rate Property Management

May-18 6.1                  $185 $1,126.50

Jun-18 11.6                $183 $2,118.00

Jul-18 6.6                  $185 $1,219.00

Total Property Management 24.3                $184 $4,463.50

Receiver Hours Rate Receiver
May-18 31.7                $375 $11,887.50
Jun-18 30.5                $375 $11,437.50
Jul-18 26.2                $375 $9,825.00
Total Receiver 88.4              $375 $33,150.00

Receivership Administration Hours Rate
Receivership 

Administration
May-18 4.7                  $64 $302.00
Jun-18 4.0                  $66 $262.00
Jul-18 1.5                  $64 $95.50
Total Receivership Administration 10.2              $65 $659.50

Sell/Liquidate Assets Hours Rate Sell/Liquidate Assets
May-18 8.5                  $176 $1,493.50
Jun-18 24.0                $167 $4,017.00
Jul-18 8.9                  $177 $1,579.00
Total Sell Liquidate Assets 41.4              $171 $7,089.50

Total All Activities Hours Rate Total All Activities
May-18 455.3              $140 $63,561.00
Jun-18 277.2              $126 $34,798.00
Jul-18 171.2              $143 $24,543.00
Total All Activities 903.7            $136 $122,902.00

Exhibit A - Page 15

Case 8:16-cv-02257-CJC-DFM   Document 296   Filed 09/21/18   Page 16 of 83   Page ID
 #:10166



Thomas Seaman Company
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA 92614

SEC vs. PDC Capital
Thomas Seaman, Receiver
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA 92614

August 29, 2018

Invoice submitted to:

Invoice #11201

Professional Services

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

Accounting & Reporting         

5/3/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.50 47.50
95.00/hrProcessed wire transfer re Beroca to Marina & crew.  Forwarded

details re same.

5/4/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.20 209.00
95.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed accounts payable.  Met

with Thomas Seaman re approval of same and gave instructions to
Bonnie Carver re sending payments.

5/7/2018 TM Accounting & Reporting 0.20 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrEmail from Fates and call from Tom re starting fee app. Ran initial

reports and checked timeslips.

5/9/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 57.00
95.00/hrReceived inquiry re payment status of SAL Lincoln property taxes. 

Reviewed tax payment information and informed Tim McDonnell.

5/11/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.40 38.00
95.00/hrProcessed wire transfers re repairs vendors for Beroca sale.

5/15/2018 TM Accounting & Reporting 1.20 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrChecked timeslips for fee app.

5/16/2018 TM Accounting & Reporting 1.00 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrChecked timeslips for upcoming fee app and made corrections.

AJ Accounting & Reporting 0.30 63.00
210.00/hrCall with Tom and John Bulgozdy re reports requested for

payments to defendant. Review email from John with report on
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

payments to Ferrante and Francisco.

5/17/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.70 66.50
95.00/hrReceived instructions from Darren Clevenger re Beroca vendor

payments and sent wire transfers.  Ran report of MCC wires
received per request from Receiver.

5/18/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 28.50
95.00/hrProcessed wire re TRC Tucson advance.

5/22/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 28.50
95.00/hrReviewed treasury accounts funds availability and discussed

investment outlook with Thomas Seaman.

AJ Accounting & Reporting 0.60 126.00
210.00/hrReconcile accounts and prepare reports.

5/23/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.40 133.00
95.00/hrConferred with Darren Clevenger and then met with Thomas

Seaman re financials needed for ProLoading sale.

5/24/2018 TM Accounting & Reporting 1.00 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrChecked timeslips. Made edits for clarification and punctuation. Ran

new timeslip reports and input timeslip data onto fee app
spreadsheet.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 5.30 503.50
95.00/hrReviewed accounting and ran financial reports for ProGrade sale

analysis.  Met with Darren Clevenger to review financial statements
and asset valuations re same.  Met with Thomas Seaman & Darren
to discuss financials, sale aspects, etc.  Received instructions from
Receiver to complete liquidation analysis.

5/25/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.80 76.00
95.00/hrCompleted liquidation analysis and provided to Thomas Seaman

with supporting financials.  Conferred with Darren Clevenger re
same.

5/29/2018 AJ Accounting & Reporting 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrReview email from Tom with instructions on exhibit for report six.

Prepare final exhibits and email to group.

5/31/2018 DC Accounting & Reporting 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrRead and responded to email from Ted Fates regarding numbers in

report; conveyed to receiver.

TM Accounting & Reporting 2.20 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrEntered timeslip and SFAR data into fee app. Ran reports and

added timeslip info to worksheet.
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    Hrs/Rate          Amount

5/31/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 28.50
95.00/hrConferred with Thomas Seaman re ProGrade liquidation analysis.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.60 247.00
95.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed accounts payable.  Met

with Thomas Seaman re approval of payments.

SUBTOTAL: [ 22.20 1,712.50]

Forensic Accounting              

5/1/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.50 315.00
210.00/hrReview progress and work on revisions to entries. Confer with Heidi

re question on Credit card statements needed.

HG Forensic Accounting 3.30 231.00
70.00/hrLook for Credit card files and make missing credit card statement

list.

5/2/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrDirect Bonnie re accounts to enter, answer questions re same.

AJ Forensic Accounting 2.60 546.00
210.00/hrWork on corrections and revisions to accounts and entries. 

5/3/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 3.80 266.00
70.00/hrLook for Credit card files and make missing credit card statement

list. Edit some transactions. 

AJ Forensic Accounting 3.60 756.00
210.00/hrContinue to work on cleaning up accounts and making corrections.

Finalize and email report to John Bulgozdy with update figures on
payments to and on behalf of Ferrante.

5/4/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 2.60 182.00
70.00/hrEdit some transactions in QuickBooks. 

BC Forensic Accounting 4.20 252.00
60.00/hrMade cc entries into Quickbooks PDC - Capital One #8544

AJ Forensic Accounting 3.90 819.00
210.00/hrExport transactions and work on reconciliations. Pull statements

and make corrections and revisions to transactions as needed.

5/7/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 4.70 987.00
210.00/hrWork on reconciling the payments to and from affiliates. Confer with

Bonnie and Kim re credit card entries, and give direction re same.   
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5/7/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 3.40 204.00
60.00/hrMade cc entries into Quickbooks PDC - Capital One #8544

KW Forensic Accounting 7.60 494.00
65.00/hrTraining and entering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card

1087.

5/8/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 6.10 427.00
70.00/hrTurn in Credit Card Missing Bank Statement List. Input data into

Quickbooks for American Express Credit Card ending in 1004. 

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrConfer with Bonnie, Kim and Heidi re credit card entries, answer

questions re same.

AJ Forensic Accounting 1.80 378.00
210.00/hrContinue to work on corrections and reconciliations.

KW Forensic Accounting 8.40 546.00
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 1087.

KW Forensic Accounting 8.40 546.00
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 1087.

KW Forensic Accounting 8.40 546.00
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 1087.

KW Forensic Accounting 8.40 546.00
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 1087.

KW Forensic Accounting 8.40 546.00
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 1087.

BC Forensic Accounting 3.50 210.00
60.00/hrMade data entries into 

TM Forensic Accounting 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived additional bank request info from Heidi.

5/9/2018 KW Forensic Accounting 6.90 448.50
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 1087 and 6786.

AJ Forensic Accounting 2.00 420.00
210.00/hrContinue to work on cleaning up accounts, making corrections and

reconciling the payments to and from affiliates.

TM Forensic Accounting 2.20 363.00
165.00/hrPrepared requests for documents and sent to several bank.
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5/10/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re credit card entries, provide direction re same.

AJ Forensic Accounting 4.80 1,008.00
210.00/hrWork on revisions and corrections to transactions and accounts.

Reconciling the payments to and from affiliates, etc. 

5/11/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 2.50 525.00
210.00/hrWork on reconciling the payments to and from affiliates. Make

corrections and revisions to entries, etc. 

KW Forensic Accounting 3.60 234.00
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 6786.

5/14/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 2.70 567.00
210.00/hrContinue to make corrections and revisions to accounting entries

and work on tying out the payments to/ from affiliates.

Forensic Accounting 6.00 1,260.00
210.00/hrReview and research WMB-ROI claim for payment of outstanding

invoices.

TM Forensic Accounting 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrMade bank requests for records. Delivered in person and sent by

UPS and fax.

5/15/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 2.50 150.00
60.00/hrMade Quick Book entries into Chase  Credit Card #2801

HG Forensic Accounting 7.60 532.00
70.00/hrMake credit card missing bank statement list for other than

American Express and Discover and missing bank statement List
without full account number. Input data into Quickbooks for
American Express Credit Card ending in 1004. 

Forensic Accounting 5.83 1,225.00
210.00/hrReview and research WMB-ROI claim for payment of outstanding

invoices

AJ Forensic Accounting 3.70 777.00
210.00/hrContinue to reconcile the payments to and from affiliates, revise

transactions, make corrections, etc.

KW Forensic Accounting 4.80 312.00
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 6786.

5/16/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 2.00 120.00
60.00/hrMade Quickbook credit card entries for  CC # 2801
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5/16/2018 KW Forensic Accounting 4.30 279.50
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 6786.

Forensic Accounting 5.40 1,134.00
210.00/hrAudit invoices of Wallis Murphy Architecture to determine total

amount incurred and reconcile to PDC quickbook totals.

AJ Forensic Accounting 4.70 987.00
210.00/hrContinue to work on reconciling accounts, correcting entries, and

balancing payments to and from affiliates. 

5/17/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 7.60 532.00
70.00/hrInput data into Quickbooks for American Express Credit Card

ending in 1004. Change accounts for Bank of Stockton and
Hongmei Lu. Make journal entries to adjust payroll expense.
Reconcile the month with closing date 02/112/2015.

BC Forensic Accounting 5.20 312.00
60.00/hrVerified Quick Books entries for Robert Ferrante 

KW Forensic Accounting 4.60 299.00
65.00/hrEntering quickbooks entries for Chase credit card 6786.

Forensic Accounting 3.30 693.00
210.00/hrAudit invoices of Wallis Murphy Architecture for accuracy and

reconcile to PDC quickbooks.

AJ Forensic Accounting 5.00 1,050.00
210.00/hrWork on correcting entries, and balancing payments to and from

affiliates. Complete report for John and email.  Call with Tom re
same. 

5/18/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 3.10 186.00
60.00/hrMade Quickbook credit card entries for  CC # 2801

BC Forensic Accounting 3.00 180.00
60.00/hrVerified Quick Books entries for Robert Ferrante 

Forensic Accounting 5.00 1,050.00
210.00/hrAudit invoices of Wallis Murphy Architecture for accuracy and

reconcile to PDC quickbooks totals.

AJ Forensic Accounting 2.20 462.00
210.00/hrConfer with Bonnie and Kim re cc entries. Give direction re same.

Review progress and run reports to review payments to insiders,
etc.  Review unknown transactions and research same.

5/21/2018 Forensic Accounting 3.00 630.00
210.00/hrAudit invoices of Wallis Murphy and reconcile to PDC quickbooks

payments to determine total cost incurred.
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5/21/2018 TM Forensic Accounting 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from JPMorgan Chase with request for documentation re some

accounts of our recent request.

AJ Forensic Accounting 1.00 210.00
210.00/hrReview accounting progress and research transactions, etc.

Provide direction to staff.

5/22/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 4.00 240.00
60.00/hrMade Quickbook credit card entries for  CC # 2801

Forensic Accounting 6.00 1,260.00
210.00/hrAudit invoices of Wallis Murphy for accuracy and reconcile to PDC

quickbooks totals.  Compose letter explaining audit and Wallis
Murphy's request for claim.

5/23/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 3.90 234.00
60.00/hrMade Quickbook credit card entries for  CC # 2801

Forensic Accounting 6.00 1,260.00
210.00/hrAudit Wallis Murphy Architecture invoices and reconcile to PDC

quickbooks.  Compose letter detailing audit and Wallis Murphy
request for claim.

5/24/2018 Forensic Accounting 3.00 630.00
210.00/hrAudit Wallis Murphy Architecture invoices and reconcile to PDC

quickbooks. Prepare summary of findings to determine validity of
Wallis Murphy's claim.

5/25/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 0.90 54.00
60.00/hrMade Quickbook credit card entries for  CC # 2801

TM Forensic Accounting 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from bank re need for documentation re request for records.

TM Forensic Accounting 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrEntered data into spreadsheet to be sent to Chase re why entities

are considered to be receivership entities.

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.80 168.00
210.00/hrConfer with Tim re Chase inquiry on records request. Review same,

and confer with Heidi re same. Give Tim direction re records that
are not needed. Update entity list. 

AJ Forensic Accounting 1.40 294.00
210.00/hrReview transactions and progress on credit card entries. Confer

with Bonnie re same. Run reports and review unidentified
transactions. 
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5/29/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 2.00 120.00
60.00/hrMade Quickbook credit card entries for  CC # 2801

TM Forensic Accounting 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived letter from Chase re need to re-send request for

documentation due to incorrect name of bank. Call to bank to clarify
and received instructions.

AJ Forensic Accounting 2.60 546.00
210.00/hrReview progress and direct staff on entries. Run reports and review

unidentified transactions. Research books and records to allocate to
the proper account.

5/30/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 1.70 357.00
210.00/hrReview entries and missing data. Reconcile the investor balance to

the claims report. Discuss variance issue with Tom re Meridian at
Stuart. Print statements and give direction to Bonnie on entering in
Quickbooks. Answered questions re same.  Run reports, review
progress, and review transactions.

BC Forensic Accounting 1.50 90.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Meridian at Stuart, LLC WF -6870

TM Forensic Accounting 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrCall from JPMorgan Chase re status of revised request, gathered

new contact info re same. Gathered info to send to them.

5/31/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 3.50 210.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Meridian at Stuart, LLC WF -6870

HG Forensic Accounting 3.80 266.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account 1004.

Reconcile the data already entered. 

SUBTOTAL: [ 254.73 31,255.00]

Investor Relations                  

5/2/2018 TM Investor Relations 2.00 330.00
165.00/hrEmail from attorneys re items to post to website re Phoenix project

transfer.  Downloaded numerous documents from PACER and
prepared posting to website. Made translation page for Heidi and
posted English part of Phoenix sale motion.

TM Investor Relations 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrRequest from Tom to send notice to Phoenix investors. Gathered

email addresses from Darren. Email to attorneys re any other notice
required.

5/3/2018 DC Investor Relations 0.80 148.00
185.00/hrResearch investor contact info in addition to email addresses in

order to provide  notification of sale proceedings for Phoenix
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property. Searched in physical files, email and Box account. Met
with Tim McDonnell.

5/3/2018 HG Investor Relations 0.90 63.00
70.00/hrTranslate Receiver's Motion for Phoenix Property from English to

Chinese. 

TM Investor Relations 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail from Diaz re noticing requirements. Replied re same and

received direction in next email. Discussed if any mailing addresses
are in possession for Phoenix investors to send mailing via normal
mail, as well. Searched for addresses.

5/4/2018 TM Investor Relations 1.80 297.00
165.00/hrFinalized website update with Chinese translation. Posted and sent

emails to subscribers and sent emails to all Phoenix investors re
recent post of sale. Manually added Phoenix investors to email
service.

5/5/2018 TM Investor Relations 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrEmail from attorneys with order re approval of claims process.

Downloaded numerous documents from PACER into pubdocs.
Made translation page for Heidi. Posted English language pages
with updates and made back-ups.

5/7/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrReview email from Tim re claims procedure approved. Confer with

Tom re timing on notice, etc.

HG Investor Relations 0.90 63.00
70.00/hrTranslate Approving the Claims Procedures Motion from English to

Chinese. Review translations made before. 

TM Investor Relations 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrReceived Chinese translation for the claims process orders and

several minor updates to correct previous errors. Made changes
and back-ups. Posted to website and sent emails to subscribers
and group.

TM Investor Relations 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Tom to get publication deadlines re legal notices for

Tampa Bay Times and Orange County Register. Calls to both,
gathered contact info. Email to OCR re same and received reply.
Email to group.

5/8/2018 AJ Investor Relations 1.50 315.00
210.00/hrWork on revisions to claim for notice letter, and claim form. Confer

with Tom and Tim re same.

AJ Investor Relations 0.90 189.00
210.00/hrWork on updating investors contact information for claims form

mailing. Research records, etc.
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5/8/2018 TM Investor Relations 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrArranged for Notice of Claims Bar Date narrative to be sent to

correct people at Tampa Bay Times and Orange County Register
with instructions to call me to arrange payment. Discussed with
Tom and Alison the needed dates.

TM Investor Relations 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Alison re need for email address for claims process for

PDC. Made, checked and sent password info to her. Call from
Alison re narrative to post to website.

5/9/2018 HG Investor Relations 4.80 336.00
70.00/hrTranslate Investor Notice Letter (Claims) fro English to Chineses. 

AJ Investor Relations 2.90 609.00
210.00/hrReview email from David with claim form instructions. Revise and

prepare for posting and mailing. Format claim form and instructions
and print. Confer with Tim and Kim re posting to web and the notice
mailing list.  Receive mailing labels from Kim and provide instruction
to admin staff on preparing notices for mailing. Work with Heidi on
the investor notice letter translation. 

TM Investor Relations 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrCall to Tampa Bay Times and Orange County Register to pay for

Notice of Claims Bar Date. Email to Zaro re notice and received
reply. Arranged payment for both papers. Email to group.

TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrMet with investors re claim forms. Got Alison to handle their

questions.

5/10/2018 HG Investor Relations 5.60 392.00
70.00/hrTranslate Investor Notice Letter (Claims) from English to Chinese.

Translate Notice of Claims Bar Date from English to Chinese. 

AJ Investor Relations 1.30 273.00
210.00/hrWork on claims letter to investors and confer with Heidi and Kim re

same. Direct Kim re remaining claim forms needed for creditors,
and mailing of same.

TM Investor Relations 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrDownloaded PACER documents into pubdocs.

TM Investor Relations 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrChanges to html. Made backups re website of receivership.

5/11/2018 AJ Investor Relations 3.20 672.00
210.00/hrWork on reformatting the claims letter for investors. Confer with

Heidi re same. Give direction to Kim on merging the data into the
fields on letter. Prepare email narrative, and send instructions to
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Kim to access the PDc claims email account. Review same. 

5/11/2018 HG Investor Relations 1.50 105.00
70.00/hrFinalize the translation of Investor Notice Letter (Claims) and Notice

of Claims Bar Date.

AJ Investor Relations 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrReview email from Kim re claim letters sent, and number of

exceptions.

KW Investor Relations 4.60 299.00
65.00/hrCreating PDFs and emailing EB-5 Claim forms to investors. 

TM Investor Relations 2.50 412.50
165.00/hrPosted website update with claim forms. Made changes to html,

edits per Alison.

5/14/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.70 147.00
210.00/hrReview emails and messages related to investor claims notices,

confer with Kim re ame. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrReview messages from investors and attorneys re claim letter.

KW Investor Relations 7.80 507.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

5/15/2018 DC Investor Relations 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReceived multiple emails from investors regarding claims and

addresses.  Responded and updated database accordingly.

DC Investor Relations 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrHandled more investor inquiries; forwarded and updated where

appropriate. Contacted Thomassen to verify information.

AJ Investor Relations 1.40 294.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re claims letter mailing status, review messages

from investors and work on updating emails, etc. 

KW Investor Relations 3.50 227.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

5/16/2018 KW Investor Relations 4.00 260.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.30 63.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re notice to investors, answer questions, give

direction, etc. 
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5/17/2018 KW Investor Relations 3.20 208.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

5/18/2018 HG Investor Relations 1.00 70.00
70.00/hrTranslate Claim forms Email from English to Chinese. 

KW Investor Relations 4.30 279.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

TM Investor Relations 1.80 297.00
165.00/hrMade claim notice email and sent to subscribers. Made translation

page.

AJ Investor Relations 0.90 189.00
210.00/hrReceive and review emails re claims for investors and creditors.

Respond to same.  Forward claim letters to Kim for processing. 

5/21/2018 KW Investor Relations 4.60 299.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

AJ Investor Relations 1.40 294.00
210.00/hrReview claims from Ted for Richardson. Forward to Kim for

processing.  Review other emails and inquiries related to investor
claims, etc.

5/22/2018 DC Investor Relations 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived updated email address for Caffe Primo investors. 

Forwarded to claims@pdcreceiver.com and updated master
spreadsheet.

AJ Investor Relations 0.80 168.00
210.00/hrReview emails re claims etc. Answer questions from attorney, and

direct Kim re claims processing. 

KW Investor Relations 4.80 312.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

KW Investor Relations 4.80 312.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

5/23/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.70 147.00
210.00/hrReview and respond to emails re claim questions, etc. Confer with

Kim re same.

KW Investor Relations 5.50 357.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

5/24/2018 KW Investor Relations 3.40 221.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.40 84.00
210.00/hrReview emails and correspondence. Confer with Kim re same, and

forward message requiring response.
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5/25/2018 KW Investor Relations 3.10 201.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrReview messages and correspondence from investors and

creditors re claims, confer with Kim re same.

5/29/2018 DC Investor Relations 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived multiple emails from investor representatives. Updated

spreadsheet and forwarded emails to claims person and claims
email address.

KW Investor Relations 2.80 182.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

AJ Investor Relations 1.70 357.00
210.00/hrReview emails and correspondence re claim notices, etc. Confer

with Tom and Kim re same. Review worksheet and search for
missing contact info. Update worksheet and advise Kim re sending
notices. Review number of claims received, etc.

5/30/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrEmail and confer with Kim re creditor inquires about claims. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrReview email from Darren with claim info

AJ Investor Relations 0.70 147.00
210.00/hrReview claims and correspondence. Confer with Kim re status on

claims, emails, etc.

TM Investor Relations 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Tom with direction to send info to Zaro re notice given to

Phoenix investors. Researched info and sent info with explanation.
Changed incorrect email address which bounced back.

KW Investor Relations 1.50 97.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

5/31/2018 TM Investor Relations 1.60 264.00
165.00/hrReceived email with items to post to website re Summerset

settlement. Saved items to pubdocs, prepared narrative, code.
Published English page and Case Documents page. Prepared
translation page for Heidi. Received translation and posted. Saved
backups. Sent emails to subscribers. Re-set password with NS.

AJ Investor Relations 0.80 168.00
210.00/hrReview and respond to emails and correspondence, including claim

form letters and requests for status on case, etc.   
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5/31/2018 HG Investor Relations 0.70 49.00
70.00/hrTranslate Summerset Settlement from English to Chinese.

KW Investor Relations 2.70 175.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

SUBTOTAL: [ 116.10 12,616.00]

Manage Business                  

5/8/2018 DC Manage Business 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReviewed liability quote for ProLoading.  Had call with broker and

sent email to Sean regarding sales number of 1.5MM.  Requested
to see premium impact of 750k and 1MM in sales.

5/10/2018 DC Manage Business 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived liability quote from broker.  Reviewed and discussed with

Sean Cummins.  Asked for financing and instructed on signature
and payment once financing agreement was received; confirmed
property insurance payment.

5/11/2018 DC Manage Business 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrLogged in to Pro Loading remotely and reviewed accounting reports.

5/16/2018 DC Manage Business 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrRead and responded to email re ProLoading.

5/21/2018 DC Manage Business 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReceived request for copy of Appraisal for Montana land from

appraiser on behalf of current tenant.  Responded that I will discuss
with Receiver and give direction later.

5/22/2018 DC Manage Business 0.60 111.00
185.00/hrReceived, reviewed and saved banks statements for March and

August.  Met with Matthew Flahive to review financials for
ProLoading. 

5/23/2018 DC Manage Business 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrHad can with Matthew Flahive to review status of financials and

Quickbooks at ProLoading office.  Went through items to review
with receiver. Reached out to manager to confirm reasoning behind
large order still on payables, and undelivered.

SUBTOTAL: [ 2.10 388.50]
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Project Management              

5/1/2018 DC Project Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrResponded to multiple video alarms from Zanjero property.

5/2/2018 DC Project Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrSent list of email addressed to Tim McDonnell for notification of

Phoenix sale.

DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrResponded to video alarm calls and reviewed videos. Four times

throughout day.

DC Project Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReviewed invoice for Marina and covered period. Consulted with

broker re timing of sale and approved; forwarded to accounting.

AJ Project Management 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrReview email from SEC requesting update figures on payments to

insiders.

5/3/2018 DC Project Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrApproved payment to captain and first mate for Beroca.  Received

pictures of engine repairs and piece of equipment needing
replacement.  Sent to broker for assistance with obtaining new part.
Sent pictures of repairs completed to two people making offers to
encourage higher bids.

5/7/2018 AJ Project Management 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrReview email from John re credit card records. 

5/8/2018 DC Project Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrVerified data in spreadsheet for notifying investors of claims

process; answered receivers questions.  Searched email for any
missing contact info and sent email to Thomassen to verify
completeness of spreadsheet.

AJ Project Management 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrEmail from John Bulgozdy requesting update on Emilio and Marilyn

numbers.

5/10/2018 DC Project Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrResponded to broker regarding Primo Hospitality Group outstanding

insurance balance.

5/11/2018 AJ Project Management 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrCall with Ted re case status and actions against insiders.

5/14/2018 AJ Project Management 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrReview email from Ted with transcript of Chris Miller depo.  Begin to

review same.
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5/15/2018 DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived email from broker and carrier regarding photos of

ProLoading.  Called regarding instruction from carrier; sent photos.

DC Project Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrRead and responded to emails from ProLoading manager.

DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrDownloaded and saved new photos for ProGrade for insurance

company.  Read and responded to email form Sean.

AJ Project Management 0.30 63.00
210.00/hrConfer with Marlyn re the Wallis contracts and PDC emails. Provide

with email drive

AJ Project Management 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrReview email from John Bulgozdy requesting update and timing on

figures for Emilio. 

5/17/2018 AJ Project Management 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrCall with Tom and Ted Fates re Li Zhao issues and settlement terms

DC Project Management 0.80 148.00
185.00/hrReceived quotes for repairing hydraulic winch and switches. 

Converted currency.  Reached out for quote comparisons from local
boat shops.  Discussed with boat broker.  Reviewed photos, save to
files, approved work and forwarded quote to accounting with
payment instructions.

5/21/2018 DC Project Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReceived instruction from Receiver to locate documents related to

Lincoln IL and Murphy Austin letter.  Scanned and sent to receiver
and saved to file.

DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived documents for settlement agreement for Ranch Cordova

and transfer of membership.  Went to receiver for signature and
review.  Scanned and sent to counsel and saved to Receiver's files.

DC Project Management 0.70 129.50
185.00/hrHad call with Sean Cummins to discuss Receiver's 5th report and

status of counter offer.  Met with Matthew Flahive and gave
direction re financials.  Printed documents to meet with receiver to
craft offer.

5/22/2018 DC Project Management 1.20 222.00
185.00/hrWorked on document for receiver to complete offer to ProLoading

managing member to make purchase. Shared appraisal as
appraisal amount was higher than initial buyout amount. Worked on
spreadsheet analyzing prior offer with input of new data.
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5/22/2018 DC Project Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrResponded to appraiser in Montana regarding release of document.

TM Project Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrRequest from Tom to find PACER documents. Downloaded many

documents from PACER and gave requested to Tom.

5/23/2018 DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived, reviewed, researched and responded to email containing

attachment regarding insurance for Primo Hospitality.

5/24/2018 DC Project Management 0.60 111.00
185.00/hrMet with Receiver and Matthew Flahive to go over financials,

operating agreement, indebtedness and structure of offer. 
Reviewed all documents with receiver in preparation for negotiation
of sale of ProLoading.

DC Project Management 1.80 333.00
185.00/hrPrepped financials, offer letter, and backup documentation to prep

Receiver for negotiating sale of ProLoading.

5/25/2018 DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived and reviewed carrying costs and invoices for Phoenix

property.

DC Project Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrSent email to ProLoading manager letting him know that receiver is

working up offer.

DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived notification that new impeller was received and broker

had sent impeller sent to Mexico.  Notifed first mate re location of
pickup and install plan.

5/29/2018 DC Project Management 1.60 296.00
185.00/hrWorked with counsel assistance for multiple investors and USCIS

website to update status of all investor cases for Receiver in order
to file with court,

5/30/2018 AJ Project Management 0.40 84.00
210.00/hrUpdate entity list, add missing EIN, move non affiliates to separate

tab. Email list to Kim. 

TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Alison re previously unknown entity. Searched files to

determine if any direction had ever been given to a bank re entity.
Replied to Alison.

5/31/2018 DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrMet with Receiver to review ProLoading docs in preparation for his

call with general partner.
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5/31/2018 DC Project Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReviewed and printed updated ProLoading documents in

preparation for meeting with Receiver.

DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReviewed and responded to emails from Thomassen office and

updated them on case status for Tucson, Sarasota and other
projects.

SUBTOTAL: [ 14.80 2,779.50]

Property Management           

5/2/2018 DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrDiscuss progress on 1415 N Main with receiver.

5/9/2018 DC Property Management 0.70 129.50
185.00/hrReceived email from receiver regarding forwarded email from

mortgage holder on 1415 Main St and seemingly expired fire
insurance.  Tracked down copy of new policy and had call with
broker.  Sent policy to mortgage holder with detailed information
and instructions on being added as additional insured.

5/10/2018 DC Property Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReceived multiple emails regarding additional insureds for 1415 N

Main.  Organized and sent email to broker to get certs and
additional insureds on for 1st, 2nd and 3rd trust deed holders.

5/14/2018 DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReviewed and approved new repair for hydraulic system for Beroca.

5/15/2018 DC Property Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived response from CIty Attorney regarding fines, citations,

and payments. Responded.  Sent out email to potential contractor
and had call.

DC Property Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReceived new policy for 1415 N Main St. based on vacant building

status and reviewed amount of incoming returned premium.  Sent
policy to additional cert holders.  Had call with broker to get timeline
of certs.  Saved policy to files and notified accounting re premium
being refunded.

DC Property Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrPrinted policy documents for new vacant building policy.  Obtained

signatures, scanned and sent back to broker.  Passed bill to
accounting to cut check.

DC Property Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrRead and responded to email from city attorney regarding 1415 N

Main St.  Forwarded to potential contractor.
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5/16/2018 DC Property Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived email from Code Enforcement from Santa Ana. 

Reviewed and sent email to senior code enforcement officer with
specific questions regarding citations and timeline.

5/17/2018 DC Property Management 0.70 129.50
185.00/hrReceived email from broker regarding policy cancellation fro 1415

N.Main St. due to status change (vacant property).  Reviewed policy
proposal, had follow up Questionnaires&A with broker, obtained
signatures, scanned and sent to broker with payment instructions to
accounting.

5/18/2018 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall to Tom re Santa Ana storage bill.

5/21/2018 DC Property Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrDiscussed 1415 N Main St with receiver and content of email from

City attorney.

DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrConfirmed schedule during Memorial Day for Eyesite security at

Phoenix property.

DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrEmailed Brad Hankins to get security system password for live calls.

DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrContacted contractor regarding repairs to 1415 N Main St.

5/24/2018 DC Property Management 0.90 166.50
185.00/hrReceived video alarms from Phoenix property.  Logged in to review

footage.  Had call with security company and gave instruction. Had
call with Glendale PD.

5/25/2018 DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReceived additional request from mortgage holder of 1415 N Main

St.  Responded and sent second request to broker.

5/30/2018 DC Property Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived email from Mortgage holder for 1415 N. Main St listing

amounts owed for 1st, 2nd and 3rd Trust Deeds.  Saved to file and
discussed with receiver and next steps.

5/31/2018 DC Property Management 0.60 111.00
185.00/hrReceived multiple alarms for Phoenix Property.  Reviewed footage

and had calls with security company; gave direction.
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5/31/2018 DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReviewed email from manager re costs.

SUBTOTAL: [ 6.10 1,126.50]

Receiver                                

5/1/2018 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re SEC and Phoenix motion

approval issues re same, Telephone call with Jacob Gehl re
nonpayment of commission and Tucson listing

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Florida brokers re pending transactions

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrExecute contracts and amendments, notices for Phoenix 

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrEmail communications re details of PSA with Debbie Hall

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrEamils with David Zaro re MCC clsoing details

5/2/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrGive direction re noticing Phoenix motion

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer re property issues at Main Street

5/4/2018 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Mike Farrell re extension, litigation status

5/7/2018 TAS Receiver 1.10 412.50
375.00/hrReview Lincoln snf/il parcels lender payoff demand review Howard's

listing, negotiate reduction, develop pricing for sale, negotiate same
with Solana - Steve Barklis.

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Lincoln Village sale

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates re Rancho Cordova transaction

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re claims process matters

5/8/2018 TAS Receiver 1.20 450.00
375.00/hrDeal with notice and publication, set schedule re submit and print

dates, determine claims bar date, edit notice, letter, and claim form,
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notice by email, other

5/8/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re broker, court approval of

commission, etc

5/9/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview and approve comments to Rancho Cordova settlement

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrSupervise claims notice form and mailing. Confer with Alison and

provide direction re same.

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Lincoln Village sale details

5/10/2018 TAS Receiver 1.40 525.00
375.00/hrReview Pappas payoff demand, timing re Barklis sale, develop

position, Telephone call with David Zaro re same, Telephone call
with Pappas re same, follow up call re timing on NOD re relief,
review new demand letter, Telephone call with David Zaro re same,
prepare email re same, Telephone call with Thad Johnson re same

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrReview draft PSA on Lincoln IL/SNF, forward to buyer

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview and execute contract to sell boat confer re other offers,

direct re best and final, follow up and direct re proceeding,
Telephone call with David Zaro re same

5/14/2018 TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrRetrieve Wallis Boyington emails and accouting, invoices from

defendants records, meet with Marlymn re reconciliation of same

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re MCC closing time extension, boat

contract

5/15/2018 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re overbid notice on Calif. portfolio,

MCC settlement and amendment to PSA,    other sale details on
sale

5/16/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Phoenix transaction approved by

Court, next steps and closing details

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Alison and John at SEC re accounting reports

needed, review and direct re same
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5/17/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jacob Gehl re Tucson listing, closings on other

projects, Phoenix situation

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrRequest financials on Tucson

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jake re Tucson liquidity situation, HUD call

prep, funding, reorganization, etc

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates and confer with Alison re Li Zhao

settlement terms

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates re Rancho Cordova settlement

approval motion, retrieve documents, financials, review accounting,
etc

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re boat sale, motion re same, confer

with Darren re memo on sales activity and transaction history

5/18/2018 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates re details for yacht sale approval

motion; prepare narrative re same

5/19/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re lenders and Phoenix

reorganization

5/21/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrSummarize and forward Lincoln Village payoff and stipulation terms

to David for preparing documents

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and approve Rancho Cordova settlement 

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrConfer with Marlyn re Wallis Boyington reconciliation and analysis

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Lincoln Village sale and loan mod

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re claims objections
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5/21/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted fates re Richardson claim

5/22/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and approve Rancho Cordova motion and declaration

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrMeet with Matt re Treasury managment accounting, reserves

5/23/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrCalls with David Zaro and retrieve and assemble documents re

Lincoln Village parcels

TAS Receiver 1.30 487.50
375.00/hrConfer with Matt and Darren re financials, balance sheet, valuation,

prepare counter offer to Cummins

5/24/2018 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrPrepare SFAR for quarter ending 04/30/2018, calculate inception to

date receipts and disbursements, reconcile to cash

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrMeet with Matt and Darren re Prograde financials, valuation of

assets, review and consider liabilities, develop potential buy out
scenario

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrConfer with Marlyn re Wallis Boyington reconciliation

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates re report

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with David Zaro re Phoenix closjng

5/25/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrReview draft payoff agreeement, Telephone call with David Zaro re

same, and re changes to same

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re issues re Lincooln notes and

Stipulation

5/26/2018 TAS Receiver 2.90 1,087.50
375.00/hrPrepare narrative for sixth report, add accounting

5/29/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates re report changes
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5/30/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re Meridian at Stuart accounting

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview Kurzban request for payment, confer re Matt and David re

same, and direct re same

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrSearch for brokers, Telephone call with Soutwest broker Jason re

same

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReceive email from Wheeler, prepare emails back to lenders

requesting payoffs

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrConsider Main Street exit strategies, confer with Darren and David

Zaro re same

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview Ted's redline of report, confer re same and approve

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re report content

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted Fates re report additions and changes

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Main Street resolution, Tucson

structure

5/31/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReview and approve changes to Lincoln PSA, answer other

questions re closing on California 3 properties, and publication

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview and consider draft liquidation analysis, develop counter

offer to Cumminsw

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Lincoln IL/SNF stipulation

SUBTOTAL: [ 31.70 11,887.50]
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Receivership Administration  

5/7/2018 BC Receivership Administration 1.50 90.00
60.00/hrPrepared checks to be mailed to creditors

5/9/2018 KW Receivership Administration 1.60 104.00
65.00/hrProof reading Claim Form and Instructions. Creating labels for

claims to be mailed.

5/25/2018 BC Receivership Administration 0.40 24.00
60.00/hrUpdated creditor information in excel

HG Receivership Administration 0.20 14.00
70.00/hrHelp with EIN question regarding to missing bank statement

request . Print out missing bank account list without full account
numbers.

5/30/2018 HG Receivership Administration 0.80 56.00
70.00/hrFile the documents requested from the banks. 

5/31/2018 HG Receivership Administration 0.20 14.00
70.00/hrFile the documents requested from the banks. 

SUBTOTAL: [ 4.70 302.00]

Sell Property/Liquidate Assets

5/1/2018 AJ Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrReview email from Max at Allen Matkins. Review records and

confer with Tom re same. Tom to respond with final PSA.

5/2/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReview offer from new potential buyer.  Research and forward info

to receiver.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReviewed photos of repairs made to boat.  Save to file and forward

to broker and potential buyer.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrHad call with Gary re Beroca and new buyer.

5/3/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReviewed two offers for Beroca from new buyers and had call with

Broker.  Met with receiver to discuss 130k offer and commented on
his response.  

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrDiscussed bid procedure with receiver and relayed information to

broker.
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5/3/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived proof of publication from Sacramento Bee re notice for

sale of California 3 properties. Made scan and sent to attorneys re
completion of notice requirements.

5/7/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 111.00
185.00/hrReceived offer for Beroca.  Printed and reviewed.  Met with

receiver, and discussed additional questions for broker.  Called
broker for info., obtained signature, scanned and sent back to
broker.  Had follow up call regarding filing of motion and next steps
for counter offer.

5/8/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrEmail from Shapiro re title reports Ordered new updates for Lincoln.

Received, reviewed, sent request for different APN's. Checked with
Tom. Email to title. Received replies with requests for more info and
reviewed and sent reply. Call to Premac re same.

5/9/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrReceived new title reports for the two parcels of the Lincoln

transaction to Carefield. Saved and reviewed. Emailed reply to
Premac to forward. Emails back and forth re distribution.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrDirection from Tom to prepare PSA for his signature from

previously sent PSA's. Inserted pages and removed incorrect
pages. Printed.

5/10/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReceived fully executed purchase agreement for Beroca.  Scanned

and sent to receiver to forward to counsel.  Relayed instructions for
deposit to broker.  Read and responded to email from potential
buyer and relayed additional information to receiver.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Premac re Phoenix property and replied re same.

5/11/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Tom re any potential overbidders re California 3

properties. Searched and replied back that none came in.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrReceived email with Clearwater deposit info, made folder, alerted

Tom.

5/14/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReviewed and responded to wire instruction email from Beroca

broker.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrDownloaded files for hydraulic repair (including anchor system) -

approved and notified broker to notify buyer.
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5/15/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrEmailed both brokers to check on status of deposit wire for Beroca.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrCall from Tom and reviewed liens re Westgate. Looked up info

online and in files.

5/16/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails re extension of Lincoln sale.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived and responded to Beroca broker. Had call regarding

incoming wire.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrSent email to potential buyer inquiring about wire and outlining

terms of breaking deal.

5/17/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked on status of Orlando sale process.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails from Attorney with request for confirmation re deposit re

Lincoln Red Rock sale.

5/21/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrHad conversation with receiver re status of Beroca sale.  Discussed

implementing proof of funds policy and next steps with current
bidder.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrWrote email to broker and bidder for Beroca with new instructions

and deadline.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReached out to bidder and broker re proof of funds.

5/22/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrHad call with broker regarding next steps for Beroca. 

5/23/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrDiscussed plan now that primary offer backed out and timeline to

get new offer and reach out to initial offers for Beroca.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmails from buyers and attorneys re sale of three California

properties.

5/24/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from escrow re final items. Called her back to confirm all has

been sent to her re deposit.
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5/24/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmails re sale of properties, escrow.

5/31/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrRead and responded to multiple emails from broker and repair shop

regarding installation of impeller for Beroca and location of delivery
of item.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Tom re notice information given to Zaro. Email from

attorneys re same and checked items related to Lincoln. Email from
Tom to send items to Shapiro.  Did so and called Zaro to discuss
items sent to him yesterday.

SUBTOTAL: [ 8.50 1,493.50]

For professional services rendered $63,561.00460.93

Balance due $63,561.00
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Thomas Seaman Company
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA 92614

SEC vs. PDC Capital
Thomas Seaman, Receiver
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA 92614

August 29, 2018

Invoice submitted to:

Invoice #11201

Professional Services

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

Accounting & Reporting         

6/4/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 57.00
95.00/hrConferred with Darren Clevenger and sent monthly wire transfers re

Beroca to crew & marina.

6/12/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 57.00
95.00/hrConfirmed wires re property sales and input to accounting.

6/14/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.70 66.50
95.00/hrRan reports and provided financial information to the Receiver re offer

to sell Prograde. 

6/19/2018 HG Accounting & Reporting 5.70 399.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account 1004.

Reconcile the data already entered. 

6/20/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.40 38.00
95.00/hrProcessed wire transfer re break-up fee per Receiver's instructions. 

Reviewed details of purported uncleared vendor check that was
cashed.

6/26/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.80 76.00
95.00/hrReceived instructions from Receiver and processed wire transfer re

Tucson.  Confirmed receipt of California properties sale funds and
accounted for same.
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6/27/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 28.50
95.00/hrProcessed wire transfer to Beroca crew re salaries.

6/29/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.70 66.50
95.00/hrForwarded documents to broker to open new PDC account re

Richardson claim.  Reviewed cash position with Thomas Seaman and
received instructions on funds to invest.  Received directions on
accounting for sale of CA properties.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 28.50
95.00/hrDeposited and accounted for payment received re Rancho Cordova.

6/30/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 57.00
95.00/hrReceived info from Darren Clevenger re payment for Beroca repairs

and initiated wire transfer.  Sent follow up confirmation to crew/vendor.

SUBTOTAL: [ 10.70 874.00]

Forensic Accounting              

6/1/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 1.80 108.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Meridian at Stuart, LLC WF -6870

TM Forensic Accounting 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrSearched through records to find info to send to JPMorgan re request

re entities.

6/4/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 0.40 28.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account 1004.

BC Forensic Accounting 1.50 90.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Meridian at Stuart, LLC WF -6870

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrReview credit card records received from Discover.

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.30 63.00
210.00/hrReview entries in Quickbooks and run reports to review same.

6/5/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 8.40 588.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account 1004.

Reconcile the data already entered. 

BC Forensic Accounting 1.70 102.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Meridian at Stuart, LLC WF -6870

6/7/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 2.50 150.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Meridian at Stuart, LLC WF -6870
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6/8/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 1.80 108.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Quickbooks for Credit Card ending in 2801.

6/11/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 2.60 182.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account 1004.

Reconcile the data already entered. 

6/12/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 4.60 322.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account 1004. 

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.30 63.00
210.00/hrReview progress and run reports

6/13/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 4.90 343.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account 1004.

Reconcile the data already entered. 

BC Forensic Accounting 1.20 72.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Quickbooks for Credit Card ending in 2801.

6/14/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 5.60 392.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account 1004.

Reconcile the data already entered. 

6/15/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.60 126.00
210.00/hrReceived records requested from Amex.  Use pass code and print

and review documents. Print and provide to Heidi for entering. Provide
drive to Kim for saving to pub docs.

BC Forensic Accounting 1.00 60.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Quickbooks for credit card # 2801

6/18/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re accounts finished and additional work to be done.

6/19/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 3.20 192.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Quickbooks for Chase CC # 2801

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.90 189.00
210.00/hrRun reports from Quickbooks and review progress. Meet with Kim and

provide instruction on entries. Review records requests, and evaluate
additional items needed. 

KW Forensic Accounting 1.30 84.50
65.00/hrWorking on Discovery Card records

6/20/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 4.50 270.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Quickbooks for Chase CC # 2801
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6/20/2018 KW Forensic Accounting 1.70 110.50
65.00/hrWorking on Discovery Card records

6/21/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 3.60 252.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account 1004.

Reconcile the data already entered. 

KW Forensic Accounting 1.20 78.00
65.00/hrWorking on Discovery Card records

6/25/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 0.50 30.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Chase CC 2801 

KW Forensic Accounting 1.30 84.50
65.00/hrMade entries into Chase CC #2801 

HG Forensic Accounting 0.40 28.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account ending in

1004.

6/26/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 5.90 354.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Chase CC #2801 

HG Forensic Accounting 2.70 189.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account ending in

1004.

KW Forensic Accounting 6.40 416.00
65.00/hrMade entries into Chase CC #2801 

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.40 84.00
210.00/hrConfer with Bonnie and Heidi re credit card entries, give direction re

same.

6/27/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 6.40 384.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Chase CC #2801 

KW Forensic Accounting 7.10 461.50
65.00/hrMade entries into Chase CC #2801 

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrRun reports and track progress, confer with staff re same.

6/28/2018 BC Forensic Accounting 6.50 390.00
60.00/hrMade entries into Chase CC #2801 

KW Forensic Accounting 7.60 494.00
65.00/hrMade entries into Chase CC #2801 

6/29/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 0.60 42.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account end of

1004.
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6/29/2018 KW Forensic Accounting 2.40 156.00
65.00/hrMade entries into Chase CC #2801 

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrReview progress, confer with staff re completing credit card entries,

shift work load. Answer questions, etc.

SUBTOTAL: [ 106.60 7,606.50]

Investor Relations                  

6/1/2018 KW Investor Relations 3.10 201.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Network solutions re website host and administrator.

Checked to see if info is correct by clicking through to the database.

6/4/2018 KW Investor Relations 1.90 123.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors. 

6/5/2018 KW Investor Relations 4.80 312.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. Spoke with
Lisa at the Franchise Tax Board. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.70 147.00
210.00/hrReview messages and correspondence related to claims. Confer with

Kim and respond to same. 

6/6/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re status of claims, etc.

KW Investor Relations 2.30 149.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

6/7/2018 KW Investor Relations 2.60 169.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.30 63.00
210.00/hrReview letter from attorney for investors re claim letters. Confer with

Tom and David re same. Give direction to Kim re verifying the claims
received. Email the letters to David.

6/8/2018 KW Investor Relations 3.10 201.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 
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6/11/2018 KW Investor Relations 4.30 279.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from Tampa Bay Times with affidavit re Publication of Notice of

Claims Bar Date.

6/12/2018 KW Investor Relations 3.70 240.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrPrinted Affidavits of Publication and filed with Claims Bar Date info.

6/13/2018 KW Investor Relations 3.10 201.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.70 147.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim and Tom re FTB claim. Answer questions re claims

filings, etc.

6/14/2018 KW Investor Relations 1.90 123.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrConfer with Tom re call from FTB re filing claim. Need EIN numbers.

Give direction to Kim re same. Review completed list and forward to
Tom for FTB agent.

6/15/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrConfer with Bonnie and Kim re call to attorney requesting update. 

KW Investor Relations 2.40 156.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

6/18/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re attorney response. Give direction re email.

KW Investor Relations 6.30 409.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

DC Investor Relations 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReceived texts and calls from Thomassen regarding questions on

Tucson and other projects. Researched and responded.
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6/19/2018 KW Investor Relations 3.40 221.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

TM Investor Relations 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail from Tom with report to post to website. Prepare translation

page for Heidi.

6/20/2018 KW Investor Relations 2.60 169.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

6/21/2018 HG Investor Relations 0.10 7.00
70.00/hrTranslate Receiver's Sixth Report from English to Chinese.

AJ Investor Relations 1.20 252.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re additional claim forms to send. Review title reports,

and other files and documents to get addresses. Prepare and review
with Tom. Receive additional names and addresses. Give direction to
Kim re same. 

KW Investor Relations 3.70 240.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

KW Investor Relations 2.80 182.00
65.00/hrSending out additional claim forms to creditors. 

TM Investor Relations 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrPosted Receiver's 6th Report to the Court to the website and sent

emails. Email to group.

6/22/2018 HG Investor Relations 1.40 98.00
70.00/hrTranslate Receiver's 5th Fee Application and Complaint and Initial

Summary of the Case.

AJ Investor Relations 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrReview email from Tom re investor that did not receive claim letter.

Confer with Kim re same. Research name, and email to contact re
need more info.

KW Investor Relations 3.40 221.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

TM Investor Relations 2.00 330.00
165.00/hrEmail from attorney with fee app to post to website and prepared

translation page for Heidi. Posted English page to website and posted
Court Documents page. Posted Chinese page and sent emails to
subscribers and group.
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6/22/2018 TM Investor Relations 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrMoved the initial case narrative to the bottom of the home page to

save space and shortened the summary at the top.  Made translation
page for Heidi. Published in English page.

6/23/2018 TM Investor Relations 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrAdded Case Inception summary to bottom of Chinese page and edits

to summary at top of page.  Attempted to find reason for wider
left-hand column on English page and confirmed it is the Google
Translate element. Made back-ups.

6/25/2018 KW Investor Relations 4.10 266.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

6/26/2018 KW Investor Relations 2.30 149.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

DC Investor Relations 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived email from Dennis Shen regarding Sarasota Investor. 

Looked up status and sent email.  Updated spreadsheet with email
address.

6/27/2018 KW Investor Relations 1.40 91.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrConfer with Tom re PDC creditor claim notice, look up and respond.

Confirm mailing date with Kim.

6/28/2018 KW Investor Relations 0.80 52.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

6/29/2018 KW Investor Relations 2.60 169.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

TM Investor Relations 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrChecked email addresses for storage needs.

SUBTOTAL: [ 79.70 6,562.50]
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Litigation & Support                

6/14/2018 AJ Litigation & Support 1.30 273.00
210.00/hrCall with Peter from Allen Matkins re MT transaction detail.

6/15/2018 AJ Litigation & Support 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrRevise transaction detail report for MT matter. Email to Peter and

Mike and Allen Matkins.

6/18/2018 AJ Litigation & Support 1.80 378.00
210.00/hrCall with Peter regarding info needed on turnover and number of

investors. Prepare reports with info requested and email.

SUBTOTAL: [ 3.60 756.00]

Project Management              

6/1/2018 DC Project Management 1.10 203.50
185.00/hrLogged into USCIS site to get updates to investor status and update

Matrix.  Confirm results with Thomassen office. Reached out to other
attorney offices for updates.

6/4/2018 DC Project Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReviewed Marina invoice for Beroca and approved.

6/5/2018 DC Project Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReceived email re EB5 documentation.  Researched and responded.

6/12/2018 DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrDownloaded new photos of repairs on Beroca in preparation for

upcoming sea trial and offer from new buyer.

6/14/2018 DC Project Management 1.20 222.00
185.00/hrWorked with receiver on email to Sean Cummins.  Worked with

Matthew Flahive and printed recent financials. Reviewed recent bank
statements. Gathered documents and prior offer from Sean and
discussed with receiver.

6/18/2018 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER for Court documents.

6/19/2018 DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrHad conversation with receiver regarding status of Tucson project

then had call with law firm regarding impact of possible SEC
settlement.  Received, reviewed and delivered updates re other
investors and USCIS.
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6/19/2018 DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrRead and responded to questions re Tucson; updated spreadsheet.

6/20/2018 DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrResearched severance for Mexico. Met with Receiver to discuss.

Emailed first mate for Beroca regarding potential timing of termination
of employment.

DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrRead and responded to email from Thomassen rep.

6/21/2018 DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrDownload recently filed documents off Pacer for receiver's files and

for posting on receivership website.  

6/25/2018 DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrSent emails to Eyesite surveillance to get removed from account. 

Sent email and left message for Brad Hankins as well.

DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrMade updates to matrix.

6/29/2018 TM Project Management 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrReviewed questions from banks re documents and searched for

same. Downloaded materials from California Secretary of State.

TM Project Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReviewed requirements of renewal of corporate officer list for Nevada

and other needed documents.

SUBTOTAL: [ 6.50 1,164.50]

Property Management           

6/6/2018 DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReviewed email from receiver re listing agreement for 1415 N Main St.

Updated city attorney and building inspector of progress.

DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReviewed email from receiver re listing agreement for 1415 N Main St.

Updated city attorney and building inspector of progress.

6/7/2018 DC Property Management 1.80 333.00
185.00/hrReceived report form city attorney that property had been broken into. 

Went to property to inspect damage. Took photos, talked with city
officials, arranged for additional security measures and.  Made calls to
contractors.  Reviewed work to confirm completion.

6/8/2018 DC Property Management 1.30 240.50
185.00/hrCompleted follow up work to secure property at 1415 N Main. Met

code enforcement.
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6/8/2018 DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrReceived, read and forwarded email to receiver re ProLoading.

6/11/2018 DC Property Management 2.10 388.50
185.00/hrWent to 1415 N Main St to review security measures, install and

secure new fencing to keep intruders out.  Called city officials, took
photos and forwarded to proper departments.

DC Property Management 0.80 148.00
185.00/hrDealt with multiple break-ins at Phoenix property. Reviewed video

footage and had calls with alarm company and police several times
throughout the day.

DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrRead and responded to email from city regarding weed abatement at

1415 N Main St.

DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrMet with Receiver re status of 1415 N Main St sale.

6/12/2018 DC Property Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrRead and responded to emails from city regarding 1415 N Main St.

DC Property Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrMade calls to contractors and weed abatement companies for quotes. 

Reviewed and responded to emailed questions regarding timeline.

6/14/2018 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Tom re previous storage landlords threat to sue due to door

problem.

6/15/2018 DC Property Management 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReceived, reviewed, and responded to multiple emails from manager

of Phoenix property re carrying costs and security issues. Met with
Matthew Flahive regarding bills after closing. Contacted security
company to remove my contact info from alarm.

6/17/2018 DC Property Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived and responded to multiple video alarms and calls for AZ.

6/18/2018 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to American Alarm re log of alarms.

6/19/2018 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail and reply to alarm company re report for storage.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail from temporary fence company re Fair Oaks with invoice.

Printed, approved and submitted.
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6/25/2018 DC Property Management 0.50 92.50
185.00/hrMultiple calls beginning at 5:00 AM re break ins at Arizona property.

Logged into view footage and provide instruction.

TM Property Management 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReceived report from alarm company re previous alarms. Attempted

to load it onto spreadsheet for edits to legal papers.

6/26/2018 DC Property Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReviewed salary request from captain. Consulted broker regarding

timing of sale and emailed Matthew Flahive to pay half salaries for
now with other half to come mid-month.

DC Property Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived, reviewed and responded to email from Sanitation Inspector

from City of Santa Ana regarding 1415 N Main St.  Had call and sent
follow up email regarding timing of cleanup.

6/27/2018 TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Clearwater police re parked car which was towed and

confirmed there is a contract in place.

TM Property Management 0.60 99.00
165.00/hrEmail to Barklis re temporary fence and other vendors needed for

code enforcement. Call from Carefield and they confirmed that they
will take over the temporary fencing. Email to fence company, email to
Tom.

6/29/2018 DC Property Management 1.60 296.00
185.00/hrMade calls to get quotes for maintenance on weeds and removal of

trash piles at 1415 N Main St.  Met contractor at site to review.  Had to
re-secure property with additional locks and chains.  Emailed city
attorney and building planner with update.

SUBTOTAL: [ 11.60 2,118.00]

Receiver                                

6/1/2018 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview and sign checks for bills, review cash position 

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Phoenix, closing, loan payoffs, etc

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview draft Pappas loan payoff on Lincoln Village, Telephone call

with David Zaro re edits
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6/4/2018 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Amy Sitzman re Tucson TRC deal

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrEmails and calls re Lincoln Village sale, payoff, stipulation, payoff

agreement, Telephone call with David Zaro lender's request for timing
changes, analyze same, direct re response and partial acceptance,
emails with lender re same 

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview and consider Main Street settlement draft from City, confer

with Darren re possession, etc

6/6/2018 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrExecute MCC closing documents, notary, closing details

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrAdminister Phoenix closing

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with counsel re Phoenix closing

6/7/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jake Shaeffer re cash short fall situaiton, HUD

denial of release from debt service reserve, consider strategy

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Santa Ana, Phoenix,and Lincoln

6/8/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jacob Shaeffer re Tucson re HUD, cash needs,

HUD refusal to allow debt service release, next call with them re same
and plan for same

TAS Receiver 1.40 525.00
375.00/hrAnalyze lender notes and payoff statements, analyze vs. note

balancee, calculate discounted payoff needs to make sale work, way
off, make decison to abandon, Telephone call with David Zaro re
same, Telephone call with broker re same, confer with Darren re same

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Steve Wheeler re decision to abandon, emails to

lenders re same, stipulation re same

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrPut broker and lenders in touch

6/10/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrAdminister MCC closing details
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6/11/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrAdminister MCC closing details

6/12/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Matt re accounting for MCC proceeds, Phoenix, adjusting

entries, etc

6/13/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrPrepare for conference call with HUD

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrConference call with HUD

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jake Shaeffer after conference call re need for

HUD counsel input, market study consultant selected by HUD, issues
re same, cash situation, reserve portion of payments, etc

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jake re input received from counsel, consider

possible next steps, release of debt service reserve funds, consider
options

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Tucson, HUD cash flow, courses of

action 

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrConfer with Alison re FTB claim

6/14/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Sacramento area properties

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with FTB re additional entities, direct Alison re same,

review reply and send

6/15/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Tucson David Zaro re HUD loan and Tucson cash

needs, options, reply to HUD, market study

6/16/2018 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrNote Tucson census

6/17/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Tucson partnership restructure,

disposition
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6/18/2018 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview, Li Zhao motion, research Ally receipts, approve document

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrResearch Jason Punzel candidate for Tucson review proposal

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re closing details re liens and

concluding sale

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Kissimmee, Lincoln Village, Main

Street

6/19/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview email re due diligence issues arising on Clearwater, direct

Keith re same, review document for due diligence conclusion period,
confer re alternative buyers

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrReceiver order from Court approving Rancho Cordova settlment,

forward to Beasely, Telephone call with Ted re check, closing
documents

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jacob Shaeffer Tucson

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re claims matters

6/20/2018 TAS Receiver 1.10 412.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro tucson listing terms, commission

structure, minimum for low price, performance incentive for high price,
develop structure, Telephone call with David Zaro and revise, discuss
listing terms

6/21/2018 TAS Receiver 1.40 525.00
375.00/hrExecute closing documents before notary, execute all other closing

documents, assignments, review draft closing statement, note errors
and questions, review lien holder claims and interest calculations,
liens, other closing details 

TAS Receiver 1.30 487.50
375.00/hrReview Blueprint listing agreement, note issues, review economics,

direct Tim re addendum, review same, forward same to David Zaro,
Telephone call with David Zaro re same

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrReview Tucson census

Exhibit A - Page 58

Case 8:16-cv-02257-CJC-DFM   Document 296   Filed 09/21/18   Page 59 of 83   Page ID
 #:10209



SEC vs. PDC Capital 16Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

6/22/2018 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrArrangements for Rancho Cordova closing

TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Ted FAtes re Summerset settlement

6/23/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Santa Ana disposition

6/25/2018 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrComment on Stipulation to abandon 1415 Main, GIVE David Zaro

input re same

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Blueprint brokers re value and commission

6/26/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview email from John Bulgozdy at SEC re Lincoln Village stipulation

and questions, reply to same, retrieve appraisals, information, etc

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrDetailed email to SEC re business reasons for stipulating to relief for

Lincoln Village lender

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrApprove Stipulation re Main Street

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview Blueprint proposed financial terms, confer with David Zaro re

same, develop acceptable numbers

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrEmails with David Zaro and Florida brokers re sales efforts, Stan

Whitcomb letter, other

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview Blueprints commission proposal, Telephone call with David

Zaro re same, propose alternate

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrDeal with Sun City asset, Telephone call with Stan Whitcomb, David

Zaro re same

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re SEC view of Lincoln Village

resolution

6/27/2018 TAS Receiver 0.10 37.50
375.00/hrDirect Matt re wire on Tucson
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6/27/2018 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview response from Blueprint prepare counter

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re lender stipulations on asset

dispostions

6/28/2018 TAS Receiver 0.80 300.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re commission structure, revise same, 

prepare emial re same, Telephone call with Amy re same

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrHUD conference call 

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrRead draft letter to HUD, consider same, confirm total of protective

advances made to date

6/29/2018 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrConfer with Matt re treasury management

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrDirect Matt re allocation of sale proceeds and Calif 3 properties

TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrCall with HUD counsel re letter, debt service release, suspension of

replacement reserves, stay, cash flow, value, etc

SUBTOTAL: [ 30.50 11,437.50]

Receivership Administration  

6/1/2018 BC Receivership Administration 0.90 54.00
60.00/hrPrepared checks to be mailed to creditors. Filed check backup copies.

6/4/2018 BC Receivership Administration 0.30 18.00
60.00/hrPrepared checks to be mailed to creditors. Filed check backup copies.

6/20/2018 BC Receivership Administration 0.60 36.00
60.00/hrDownloaded and scanned PDC invoices

6/21/2018 HG Receivership Administration 2.20 154.00
70.00/hrFile the documents requested from the banks. 

SUBTOTAL: [ 4.00 262.00]

Sell Property/Liquidate Assets

6/1/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Shapiro re ALTA survey. Checked with Tom and

determined none existed. Replied to email re same.

Exhibit A - Page 60

Case 8:16-cv-02257-CJC-DFM   Document 296   Filed 09/21/18   Page 61 of 83   Page ID
 #:10211



SEC vs. PDC Capital 18Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

6/4/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrRequested, received and reviewed photos of progress on Beroca

repairs.. Approved payment. Forwarded photos to broker and had call
to discuss offer and contract.

6/5/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived confirmation of wire for deposit for Beroca; reviewed

purchase/sale agreement. Sent email to broker re requirement for
buyer to show proof of funds prior to receiver signing agreement. 

6/6/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 2.10 346.50
165.00/hrFilled out escrow docs for Lincoln sale. Call to Shapiro re same. Call

to notary and set up appointment, arranged for payment in email to
Matthew for tomorrow.

6/7/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrText to Tom re appointment time for notary. Call from notary and

changed appointment time. Email from Shapiro re need for change to
signature page of General Assignment document and call to him to
verify when new document will be sent. Had Tom review docs.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 2.00 330.00
165.00/hrMet with notary and had Receiver's Deed notarized with Tom.  Email

from Shapiro re change to documents. Received and exchanged.
Made corrections and removed he dates. Calls to and from Shapiro.
Gathered signatures. Made scans and sent to Shapiro. Prepared for
sending to escrow. Hand delivered.

6/8/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrReviewed emails to and from escrow and Shapiro, call to Shapiro and

LM re Lincoln Bella Breeze sale and Summerplace at Lincoln sale.
Printed documents for Tom's signature.

6/11/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived email from broker that 20k deposit received for Beroca. 

Notified receiver and reviewed contract. Sent reminder email to broker
regarding proof of funds, especially in light of contingencies.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrCall from Shapiro re settlment statement and commission instructions.

Asked Receiver about both and gathered signatures. Scanned and
emailed back to Shapiro and escrow. Other emails to and from
attorneys and escrow re assignment. Multiple emails and sent PSA to
broker for additional signature. Call to broker re same. Email follow-up
with attorney and escrow.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmails re California 3 properties from escrow and replied. Asked Tom

if any work done on payoff notices.
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6/12/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrConfirmed receipt of deposit for boat and emailed broker re next steps.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrEmails from escrow with notice on closure of Lincoln Red Rock

property. Emails to group and call with Tom. Email from Matthew re
deposits and checked with him. Emails from Tom re same.

AJ Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrReview emails from Tim, Matt and Tom re sales proceeds, closing for

Lincoln.

6/13/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrHad call with broker regarding proof funds documentation for Beroca

purchase and his conversation with buyer and schedule.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmails to and from escrow, attorneys re California 3 properties liens,

etc. Responded.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrEmail from escrow re closure of Lincoln Red Rocks. Checked with

Matthew re email from Tom re deposits. Checked previous emails to
determine if info received.

6/15/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.70 280.50
165.00/hrEmails from escrow re title issues, liens, etc. Filled out property

information form.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.70 115.50
165.00/hrDirection from Tom to make addendum for a listing agreement for

Tucson property or partnership. Made addendum, presented with title
report.

6/18/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from escrow re loan numbers. Looked up info for Carmichael

and Citrus Heights and replied with Borrower Organizational Numbers.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.20 198.00
165.00/hrEmails to and from attorneys, escrow, title re Westgate property and

Richardson deed. Replied to several re sending official court
documents to title to reduce need for additional work. Review of
checklist of items needed for Friday close. Email to escrow re JTS
Engineering release. Call with escrow re items to be signed.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Hamlin re brokerage costs. Gave to Tom and discussed.

Looked up PSA re agreement.
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6/19/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrHad Tom sign escrow documents for California 3 properties.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.00 165.00
165.00/hrEmails to and from escrow, attorneys, prepared documents for Tom to

sign re sale of California 3 properties.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReview of documentation re Lincoln property sale.

6/20/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.60 111.00
185.00/hrWorked with broker on new PSA for broker, addendum, timing etc.

Printed final and passed to receiver for signature. Scanned and sent
to Broker.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Tom re addendum to engagement agreemtent Tucson.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Shapiro with Assignment for the California 3 properties.

Printed and had Tom sign, made scan and sent back.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.10 181.50
165.00/hrCall to temporory fence vendor for Carmichael re previous invoice and

discussed further use if new owner purchases the property. Informed
Tom re need to send info to buyer of Carmichael. Sent list of vendors
re same. Checked with Matthew re previous payment and asked for
verification of clearance of check. Received same, made pdf and sent
to vendor with comments re endorsement.

6/21/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 4.50 742.50
165.00/hrGathered Tom's signature on Grant Deed and other docs for closing

of California 3 properties. Emails to and from attorneys. Reviewed
signature lines and call to attorneys re needed change. Made changes
and had Tom sign. Made scans of all documents. Delivered to title
and escrow. Sent scans to attorneys.

6/22/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 1.60 264.00
165.00/hrEmails from escrow re bank account for Richardson proceeds, email

to Matthew and spoke with Tom. Email to escrow re disbursement.
Long email re entity documents, address, bank account of Receiver.

6/25/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrReceived, reviewed, and responded to email from broker.  Reviewed

Offer and found missing initials. Informed broker and printed new copy
for receiver to sign and initial. Provided timeline of events for hearing
and when hearing will be scheduled once contingencies removed.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 66.00
165.00/hrCall from escrow re problem with buyer's loan docs and need to do

either a gap closing or hold till tomorrow due to missing initial on
documents. Discussed with escrow and call to Tom and explained and
got direction. Call to escrow and allowed them to move forward with
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the easiest scenario to close per lender. Email letter re closing on gap
and final documents to follow. Replied with thanks to all who helped
on the transaction.

6/26/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived email with settlement statement for sale of California 3

properties. Printed for Matthew, email to same. Email to escrow.

6/28/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrFiled closing documents for previous sales.

SUBTOTAL: [ 24.00 4,017.00]

For professional services rendered $34,798.00277.20

Balance due $34,798.00
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Thomas Seaman Company
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA 92614

SEC vs. PDC Capital
Thomas Seaman, Receiver
3 Park Plaza
Suite 550
Irvine, CA 92614

August 29, 2018

Invoice submitted to:

Invoice #11201

Professional Services

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

Accounting & Reporting         

7/2/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 2.60 247.00
95.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices received for prior month and processed

accounts payable checks.  Met with Receiver for approval and gave
instructions to Bonnie Carver re sending payments.

7/9/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.50 47.50
95.00/hrReceived instructions from Darren Clevenger and processed

vendor payment re 1415 Main St cleanup.  Met vendor and provided
payment.

7/13/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.40 38.00
95.00/hrReceived instructions from Thomas Seaman and processed wire

transfer re TRC Tucson.

7/16/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.70 66.50
95.00/hrRe-issued payment not received by lender and emailed lender re

same.  Deposited insurance refund and turnover received.

7/17/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.50 47.50
95.00/hrProcessed wire transfer to Crew & Marina re Beroca.  Updated

accounting re same.

7/18/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.40 38.00
95.00/hrReceived request from Darren Clevenger re amounts spent on the

Beroca during the course of the receivership.  Pulled financial
reports and forwarded amounts spent on repairs, Marina, crew, etc.
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7/19/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.40 133.00
95.00/hrProcessed wire transfer to Tucson broker and forwarded

confirmation via email.  Created spreadsheet showing
income/expenses of CA property sales to use to input to accounting.

MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.30 28.50
95.00/hrProvided input to Darren Clevenger re Beroca sale motion. 

Reviewed financial details and provided additional/missing figures.

7/20/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 1.10 104.50
95.00/hrReviewed vendor invoices and processed accounts payable.

7/23/2018 MRF Accounting & Reporting 0.60 57.00
95.00/hrMet with Thomas Seaman to review/approve accounts payable

checks.  Gave instructions to Bonnie Carver re sending payments. 
Spoke with vendor re purported missing payment & forwarded
details.

7/31/2018 TM Accounting & Reporting 0.10 NO CHARGE
165.00/hrDirection from Tom re fee app. Minor edits to template in

preparation of gathering info.

SUBTOTAL: [ 8.60 807.50]

Forensic Accounting              

7/3/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 1.80 126.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account end of

1004.

7/5/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 1.90 133.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account end of

1004.

7/6/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 2.10 147.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account end of

1004.

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrReview bank records still outstanding, run reports and review

progress.

7/9/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 2.90 203.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account end of

1004.

7/10/2018 TM Forensic Accounting 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall with bank re attempt to get faster delivery of documents. Bank

confirmed that our request is in order and they have authorized
work to be performed.
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7/16/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 1.90 133.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account end of

1004.

AJ Forensic Accounting 3.00 630.00
210.00/hrRun reports and review unidentified transactions. Research same.

Confer with Tom re issues.

7/17/2018 AJ Forensic Accounting 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrConfer with Heidi and receive translation of iLandlords Chinese

advertising contract

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrConfer with Heidi re questions on accounts to use for transactions.

HG Forensic Accounting 7.30 511.00
70.00/hrInput data into QuickBooks for American Express account end of

1004. Reconcile the data input. 

7/19/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 2.10 147.00
70.00/hrFile the documents requested from the bank.

HG Forensic Accounting 5.40 378.00
70.00/hrGo through the files in PDC box. File them. Very fy the data by

comparing QuickBooks with the files. 

7/20/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 4.00 280.00
70.00/hrGo through the files in PDC box. File them. Prepare the list of

requesting bank statements. Check some accounts to see if there
is some money went into them.

TM Forensic Accounting 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrRequest from Heidi to request additional bank records for

previously frozen account.

7/23/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 1.20 84.00
70.00/hrGo through the files in PDC box. Verify the bills in QuickBooks. 

7/24/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 1.90 133.00
70.00/hrGo through the files in PDC box. Verify the bills in QuickBooks. Fill

the documents.

7/25/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 5.50 385.00
70.00/hrUpdated the data in American Express account ending in 1004

7/26/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 2.40 168.00
70.00/hrUpdate the data in American Express account ending in 1004

AJ Forensic Accounting 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrReview message from Tom with Amex request to return thumbdrive

of records and new device will be provided with corrected info.

Exhibit A - Page 67

Case 8:16-cv-02257-CJC-DFM   Document 296   Filed 09/21/18   Page 68 of 83   Page ID
 #:10218



SEC vs. PDC Capital 4Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

7/27/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 4.10 287.00
70.00/hrUpdate the data in American Express account ending in 1004

7/30/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 2.80 196.00
70.00/hrUpdate the data in American Express account ending in 1004

7/31/2018 HG Forensic Accounting 5.00 350.00
70.00/hrUpdate the data in American Express account ending in 1004. Input

the data into QuickBooks for this account.

SUBTOTAL: [ 56.40 4,508.50]

Investor Relations                  

7/2/2018 KW Investor Relations 4.20 273.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

HG Investor Relations 0.30 21.00
70.00/hrMeet and talk to investor about claim form turned in. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.60 126.00
210.00/hrConfer with Heidi and Kim re investor in office, claims received, etc.

Review worksheet and respond to request for claim letter.

7/3/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrReview emails and forward to Kim. Confer with Kim re claims

received and notice from attorney.  Give direction regarding
response, and review emails to and from attorney.

KW Investor Relations 3.50 227.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

7/6/2018 KW Investor Relations 6.30 409.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

AJ Investor Relations 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrReview emails and correspondence. Confer with Kim re claims.

Email to investor re need for clarification on name of claimant. 

7/9/2018 KW Investor Relations 6.80 442.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

7/10/2018 KW Investor Relations 6.30 409.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and  returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 
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7/10/2018 TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrReceived affidavit of publication of claims bar from Tampa Bay,

filed.

AJ Investor Relations 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re PDC claim forms received.

7/11/2018 KW Investor Relations 5.80 377.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

TM Investor Relations 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrMade scan of proof of publication related to Orange County

Register Claims Bar Date Notice.

AJ Investor Relations 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re claims received, and give direction on claims

summary to email.

7/12/2018 KW Investor Relations 5.10 331.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

7/13/2018 KW Investor Relations 2.30 149.50
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

7/16/2018 KW Investor Relations 0.40 26.00
65.00/hrProcessing EB-5 Claim Forms and returning emails from investors.

Processing Creditors claims and adding them to the excel. 

7/17/2018 HG Investor Relations 0.20 14.00
70.00/hrTranslate Ilandlords Chinese Advertising Contract from English into

Chinese for Alison.

KW Investor Relations 0.60 39.00
65.00/hrMailing out creditor claim copies.

7/18/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.10 21.00
210.00/hrConfer with Kim re next step on claims, verification, etc.

7/19/2018 KW Investor Relations 0.50 32.50
65.00/hrAnswered claimant inquiry email.

7/23/2018 KW Investor Relations 0.60 39.00
65.00/hrAnswered claimant inquiry email.

AJ Investor Relations 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrConfer with Tom re PDC claims, receive direction to provide

creditors summary.
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7/24/2018 DC Investor Relations 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrResponded to email regarding project status.

AJ Investor Relations 1.60 336.00
210.00/hrReview, verify and analyze creditor claims. 

7/25/2018 AJ Investor Relations 2.10 441.00
210.00/hrConfer with Tom re claims. Continue to review and analyze creditor

claims.

7/30/2018 HG Investor Relations 1.00 70.00
70.00/hrTranslate Yacht Beroca Sale Motion from English into Chinese. 

TM Investor Relations 1.50 247.50
165.00/hrEmail from attorneys to post sale motion for yacht. Made translation

page for Heidi, posted in English and Case Documents page.
Question from Heidi re type of boat. Posted Chinese page. Sent out
emails.  Email to group.

7/31/2018 AJ Investor Relations 0.80 168.00
210.00/hrConfer with Tom and Kim re creditor claim. Direction to Kim re

organization of claims. Review reprot with Tom that was prepared
by Marlyn.  Run report for Tom from accounting showing all
payments to Wallis and email same.

SUBTOTAL: [ 52.70 4,630.00]

Project Management              

7/2/2018 DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrDownload recently filed documents off Pacer for receiver's files and

for posting on receivership website.  

DC Project Management 0.60 111.00
185.00/hrReceived and responded to questions from investor.  Logged into

USCIS website for updates to cases; updated matrix.

7/3/2018 DC Project Management 1.80 333.00
185.00/hrWent to location to copy updates of USCIS notices and compare

with Jing.  Picked up mail and other deliveries.  Reviewed and
sorted mail and deliveries and pulled out urgent items including
payments due.. Pulled investor correspondence that was mailed
and reviewed documents from USCIS. Used CA SOS website to
research entities listed on some documents.

TM Project Management 2.40 396.00
165.00/hrCorrespondence with banks to arrange turnover of bank records.

7/5/2018 DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrDownload recently filed documents off Pacer for receiver's files and

for posting on receivership website.  
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7/10/2018 TM Project Management 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrDownloaded PACER files.

7/13/2018 DC Project Management 0.80 148.00
185.00/hrLogged into USCIS to get updates to case status for investor Matrix.

DC Project Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrCorrected address for refund check and notified accounting.

7/17/2018 AJ Project Management 0.40 84.00
210.00/hrEmails with Darren re information on the purchase of the Beroca

boat. Review files and emails, run report in Quickbooks, etc.
Provide data to Darren and discuss. 

DC Project Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrHad call with counsel regarding motion to sell Beroca and specific

dates.

DC Project Management 0.70 129.50
185.00/hrDocumented timeline of events regarding Beroca sale process,

expenditures and numerous obstacles encountered over the past
year in the sale efforts. Organized in chronological order and
emailed counsel with sale documents.

DC Project Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived insurance refund for 1415 Main Street for policy

alteration.  Scanned and filed.  Passed to accounting and notified
receiver.

7/18/2018 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER for new documents and downloaded.

7/19/2018 DC Project Management 0.50 92.50
185.00/hrReviewed motion for sale approval for Beroca.  Looked up

information and dates, confirmed net sale number, made edits and
forwarded to Receiver; met with receiver.

DC Project Management 0.50 92.50
185.00/hrRead and responded to email re workers comp audit. Met with

Matthew Flahive to discuss and searched for documents. Called
auditor to schedule appointment.

TM Project Management 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrRequest from Tom to find documentation re stated interest rate on

loan and broker fee for Clearwater. Searched for documentation
and reported back.

7/24/2018 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER for newly filed documents. Downloaded and

printed recent Order re Santa Ana property.

Exhibit A - Page 71

Case 8:16-cv-02257-CJC-DFM   Document 296   Filed 09/21/18   Page 72 of 83   Page ID
 #:10222



SEC vs. PDC Capital 8Page

    Hrs/Rate          Amount

7/26/2018 AJ Project Management 0.50 105.00
210.00/hrReview email from Mike Farrell. Run report and provide with

amount paid to Bronk as requested.

7/27/2018 DC Project Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrConfirmed sale motion date with counsel.

7/31/2018 TM Project Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrChecked PACER for new documents.

SUBTOTAL: [ 10.40 1,878.50]

Property Management           

7/2/2018 DC Property Management 1.10 203.50
185.00/hrWent by 1415 Main to check on property maintenance; took photos

and had call with contractor.  Inspected property and checked new
security measures.  Had call with building inspector and sent
additional information.

7/3/2018 DC Property Management 2.20 407.00
185.00/hrWent to 1415 to review remediation done to site.  Met with

contractor and went over work. Agreed to next phase.  Brought bill
back to accounting and instructed on half payment.  Includes drive
time billed at half.

DC Property Management 0.60 111.00
185.00/hrReceived pictures of second broken impeller. Forwarded to broker.

Had call with broker regarding moving the test drive of boat from
Thursday  the 5th to next Tuesday.  Approved purchase and repair
of new impeller and provided instructions to crew about Holding off
on repair until Broker sees damage. Checked price on impeller and
delivery charge with West Marine.

DC Property Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived and reviewed video alarms and sent notice to alarm

company as well as new owner.

TM Property Management 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmail to Junk Revolution re sale of Carmichael and need for final

invoice.

7/5/2018 DC Property Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReviewed more video alarms and contacted property manager and

security company.

7/6/2018 DC Property Management 1.10 203.50
185.00/hrWent to property to inspect work done previous day.  Approved next

job and gave instruction and highlighted areas that needed extra
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attention. Took photos and emailed city attorney.

7/11/2018 DC Property Management 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrSent photos of clean up to each of the deed holders and explained

the timeline of receiver giving up property. Received email
confirmations and responded.  Had call with one lender.

DC Property Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrUpdated receiver on Beroca sale status then composed email to

counsel regarding timeline and filing of motion and added questions
about severance for crew and made suggestions.

7/15/2018 DC Property Management 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived video alarms. Logged in and reviewed. Spoke with alarm

company.

7/26/2018 DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrRead and responded to 1415 Main St Owner. Reviewed email from

counsel.

7/27/2018 DC Property Management 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrSent over more information to security company to resolve

notification issues.

SUBTOTAL: [ 6.60 1,219.00]

Receiver                                

7/2/2018 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrReview emails re property lines, buyer's due diligence, and their

request for a price reduction, consider same, Telephone call with
Keith Breading broker re same, give direction and negotiate
reduced price

7/3/2018 TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re claims matters

7/5/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Mark Doucet re maturities for Richardson

funds, and unencumbered sales procees

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrDeal with Clearwater contract amendment re reduced sales price

7/10/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrCalls with broker and David Zaro re listing changes
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7/10/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrFinalize Blueprint listing language emails and calls re same, execute

7/11/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jacob Shaeffer re Tucson HUD situation,

emails re same

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Clearwater sale

7/12/2018 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrConference call with Sante and HUD counsel re potential default

and meeting

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jacob Shaeffer re how to proceed, cash flow,

default

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrPrepare email to HUD re market study

7/13/2018 TAS Receiver 0.80 300.00
375.00/hrSeveral calls with Sante re cash position, debt service payment,

Telephone call with David re making additional advance, with pros
and cons, make decision, affectuate transfer

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Stan Whitcomb re make settlement offer

7/14/2018 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Jacob re Tucson debt service, etc, email to

HUD re status of market study and our request for release of debt
service reserve

7/18/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrContinued discussions on settlement with Stan Whitcomb, confer re

mechanics, relief from stay, foreclosure, get input from David Zaro
re same

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrPrepare language re receivership sale for Tucson marketing

materials

7/19/2018 TAS Receiver 1.10 412.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Clearwater motion details, review

loan and payoff demand, note objectionable interest rate and
penalties, Telephone call with David Zaro re grounds for objecting,
review original note terms, develop settlment offer, Telephone call
with Arun Chawla re same negotiate and reach settlement, follow
up with David
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7/19/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrEmail with Sante and counsel re HUD/Barings situation

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrWork on boat sale motion issues and declaration

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Orlando, Clearwater and Beroca

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re claims matter clarfications

7/21/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrEmails with Keith Breading re overibid marketing, overbidders

questions, process and timing clarifications

7/22/2018 TAS Receiver 1.80 675.00
375.00/hrAdd language to Clearwater sale motion, re transaction history, net

proceeds, sale process, etc

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrRead Tucson TRC market study and consider same relative to

disposition strategy and plan with lender

7/23/2018 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Krone re Sun City out of listing, Summerfield

due diligence waived, deposit received, contract missing, Kissimmee

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrDeal with Clearwater sale now non-contingent, emails with broker re

overbid process and candidates, dates, timing, other

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrRetrieve and add more information to Clearwater sale motion, and

complete draft

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Tucson market study, HUD call

7/24/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re marketing, dispostion sale

strategy

7/25/2018 TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrReview Clearwater moving papers, telephone call with Ted Fates re

changes to Clearwater declaration and motion

7/26/2018 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with Mark and Jake at Sante re gameplan with HUD,

Sante buy out parameters
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7/26/2018 TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrRead Sante's proposal re Tucson, consider same

TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrEmails with Amy re marketing

TAS Receiver 0.40 150.00
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro  re  Wallis Boyington accounting

and claim relative to sale of Summerfield free and clear of liens 

7/27/2018 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrRead counsel's memo on third party litigation for damages,

consider same, prepare email re commments and questions

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrPrepare memo and assemble documentsre nature of fraud

+

TAS Receiver 0.20 75.00
375.00/hrEmail Amy re Sante ownership

7/28/2018 TAS Receiver 0.30 112.50
375.00/hrGive comments to proposed marketing materials

7/29/2018 TAS Receiver 2.10 787.50
375.00/hrAnalyze Wallis Boyington accounting review, memo, payments

made, contracts

7/31/2018 TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrReview latest version of marketing materials, suggest language re

receivership, review proformas, etc

TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with Avi re interest in Tucson TRC

TAS Receiver 0.60 225.00
375.00/hrPrepare overbid notice for brokers

TAS Receiver 0.90 337.50
375.00/hrConsider Tucson restructure proposal, Telephone call with Jacob re

same, Telephone call with David Zaro re same

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrExecute Deodar closing documents before notary; other closing

documents, disclosures, etc

TAS Receiver 0.70 262.50
375.00/hrReview Merced situation and documents, Telephone call with David

Zaro re same, consider course of action
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7/31/2018 TAS Receiver 0.50 187.50
375.00/hrTelephone call with David Zaro re Wallis Boyington findings

SUBTOTAL: [ 26.20 9,825.00]

Receivership Administration  

7/3/2018 KW Receivership Administration 1.10 71.50
65.00/hrProcessing checks to be mailed out to vendors. 

7/23/2018 BC Receivership Administration 0.40 24.00
60.00/hrcopied checks attached backup and filed. Prepared checks for

mailing to creditors.

SUBTOTAL: [ 1.50 95.50]

Sell Property/Liquidate Assets

7/2/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrFiled items related to sales of properties.

7/3/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived offer from 3rd potential buyer.  Read letter and responded

to email.

7/5/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrResponded to multiple emails from investors. Updated Matrix with

new results.

7/6/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrResponded to multiple emails from captain and broker; had call with

broker after picking up new impeller. Approved install and new trial
run for Tuesday July 10th.

7/10/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrHad call with broker before and after sea trial.  Discussed next

steps and timeline.  Sent email to receiver regarding signed
contract and successful sea run and that counsel can be notified to
prepare sale motion as soon as hard copy is received, which will be
in two days at the latest.

7/12/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrMade scan of recorded Order Approving Sale of Carmichael and

filed with other sale-related documents.

7/13/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrMet with receiver regarding signed contract and schedule.

7/17/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.90 166.50
185.00/hrWorked with broker to track down all paperwork to submit to

attorney for sale motion.
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7/18/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.40 74.00
185.00/hrSent email responsive to questions from counsel using data from

prior emails, accounting and scanned documents re Beroca.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrHad call with counsel to answer additional questions about

payments for Beroca items.

7/19/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrConferred with broker re addendum and timeline.

7/20/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 92.50
185.00/hrReceived updated sale motion and made edits. Proof read

receiver's edits, finalized and sent back to counsel.

7/23/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 55.50
185.00/hrReceived, reviewed, and printed declaration for Beroca sale. Met

with receiver, obtained signature, scanned and sent back to counsel.

DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrCalled broker regarding hearing for Beroca sale and declaration.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails re Clearwater transaction. Replied to Shapiro re same.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrCall from Fates re need for publication in Clearwater area.

7/24/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrSearched for newspaper of record for Clearwater area. Found info,

sent to Fates in email.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 33.00
165.00/hrEmail from Tom re package from buyer re Florida property.

Searched office and found no package of documents. Replied to
Tom re same.

AJ Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 42.00
210.00/hrReview email from Tom and review mail received. Confer with Tim

re Orlando package. 

7/25/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Fates re Clearwater document, reviewed and discussed

with Tom. Gathered signature, scanned and sent to Fates.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrCall from Fates re what to publish in Tampa Bay Times re

Clearwater.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 16.50
165.00/hrEmails and call from Weidler re need for document. Talked with

Tom re same.
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7/26/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Tom re status of document for escrow from buyer of

Summerfield. Searched office. Call from Alison re same.  Email and
call to brokers re same. Received reply with document and gave to
Tom.

AJ Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 63.00
210.00/hrAssist Tom with locating missing property records. Search files and

find files needed.

7/27/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.10 18.50
185.00/hrSent motion and date over to broker with breakdown of potential

outcomes; early ruling, taken under submission, ruled on date.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.30 49.50
165.00/hrEmail to Fates re Clearwater court date re publishing of notice.

Reviewed notice, email to Fates re error.

7/28/2018 DC Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.20 37.00
185.00/hrReceived final confirmed motion for sale of Beroca.  Sent document

to broker and had call.

7/31/2018 TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrCall from Fates re dates for auction and overbid deadline. Edit to

notice, email to Tampa Bay Times with instructions.

TM Sell Property/Liquidate Assets 0.50 82.50
165.00/hrQuestions from Tom re Summerfield PSA. Looked up items and

replied to Tom.

SUBTOTAL: [ 8.90 1,579.00]

For professional services rendered $24,543.00171.30

Balance due $24,543.00
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FUND ACCOUNTING (See instructions):

Detail Subtotal Grand Total

Line 1 Beginning Balance (04/30/2017): 4,550,955             4,550,955              

Increases in Fund Balance:

Line 2 Business Income ‐                         

Line 3 Cash and Securities ‐                         

Line 4 Interest/Dividend Income 14,562                  14,562                   

Line 5 Business Asset Liquidation 5,954,529             5,954,529              

Line 6 Personal Asset Liquidation ‐                         

Line 7 Third‐Party Litigation Income ‐                         

Line 8 Miscellaneous ‐ Other ‐                         

Total Funds Available (Lines 1 ‐ 8): 10,520,046          10,520,046           

Decreases in Fund Balance:

Line 9 Disbursements to Investors ‐                        ‐                         

Line 10 Disbursements to Receivership Operations

Line 10a Disbursement to Receiver or Other Professionals (811,398)              (811,398)               

Line 10b Business Asset Expenses (505,592)              (505,592)               

Line 10c Personal Asset Expenses ‐                         

Line 10d Investment Expenses ‐                        ‐                         

Line 10e Third‐Party Litigation Expenses ‐                         

   1. Attorney Fees ‐                         

   2. Litigation Expenses ‐                        ‐                         

   Total Third‐Party Litigation Expenses ‐                        ‐                         

Line 10f Tax Administrator Fees and Bonds ‐                        ‐                         

Line 10g Federal and State Tax Payments  

Total Disbursements for Receivership Operations (1,316,990)            

Line 11 Disbursements for Distribution Expenses Paid by the Fund:

Line 11a Distribution Plan Development Expenses:

1. Fees:

   Fund Administrator……………………………………. ‐                        ‐                         

   Independent Distribution Consultant (IDC).. ‐                        ‐                         

   Distribution Agent……………………………………… ‐                        ‐                         

   Consultants……………………………………………….. ‐                        ‐                         

   Legal Advisors……………………………………………. ‐                        ‐                         

   Tax Advisors………………………………………………. ‐                        ‐                         

2. Administrative Expenses ‐                        ‐                         

3. Miscellaneous ‐                        ‐                         

Total Plan Developmental Expenses ‐                         

Line 11b Distribution Plan Implementation Expenses:

1. Fees:

   Fund Administrator……………………………………. ‐                        ‐                         

   IDC……………………………………………………………… ‐                        ‐                         

   Distribution Agent……………………………………… ‐                        ‐                         

   Consultants……………………………………………….. ‐                        ‐                         

   Legal Advisors……………………………………………. ‐                        ‐                         

   Tax Advisors………………………………………………. ‐                        ‐                         

2. Administrative Expenses ‐                        ‐                         

3. Investor Identification:

   Notice/Publishing Approved Plan…………… ‐                         

   Claimant Identification………………………….. ‐                        ‐                         

   Claims Processing…………………………………… ‐                        ‐                         

   Web Site Maintenance/Call Center…………. ‐                        ‐                         

4. Fund Administrator Bond ‐                        ‐                         

5. Miscellaneous ‐                        ‐                         

6. Federal Account for Investor Restitution

(FAIR) Reports Expenses ‐                        ‐                         

Total Plan Implementation Expenses ‐                        ‐                         

Total Disbursements for Distribution Expenses Paid by the Fund ‐                         

Line 12 Disbursements to Court/Other:

Line 12a Investment Expenses/Court Registry Investment

System (CRIS) Fees ‐                        ‐                         

Line 12b Federal Tax Payments ‐                        ‐                         

Total Disbursement to Court/Other: ‐                         

Total Funds Disbursed (Lines 9 ‐ 11): (1,316,990)            

Line 13 Ending Balance (As of 07/31/2018): 9,203,056             

STANDARDIZED FUND ACCOUNTING REPORT for PDC Capital Receivership

SEC vs. PDC Capital, et al Case number 8:16‐cv‐02257‐CJC‐DFM

Reporting Period 05/01/2018 to 07/31/2018
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